AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

116TH CONGRESS REPORT
9d Session HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 116-410

STRONGER ENFORCEMENT OF CIVIL PENALTIES ACT OF
2019

FEBRUARY 27, 2020.—Committed to the Committee of the Whole House on the State
of the Union and ordered to be printed

Ms. WATERS, from the Committee on Financial Services,
submitted the following

REPORT
together with

MINORITY VIEWS
[To accompany H.R. 3641]

[Including cost estimate of the Congressional Budget Office]

The Committee on Financial Services, to whom was referred the
bill (H.R. 3641) to enhance civil penalties under the Federal securi-
ties laws, and for other purposes, having considered the same, re-
ports favorably thereon with an amendment and recommends that
the bill as amended do pass.

CONTENTS

Page
Purpose and SUMmMATY ......ccccoiieeiiiiiiieeeieeeee et ertee e eiee e veeesaee e e evaeeeevae e e
Background and Need for Legislation ...........cccccovveiiiiniiiiiniiiiieniecceeeeee e, 8
Section-by-Section ANAlYSIS .....cccccocieeiiiriiieiiienieeieecie et ete et e ereeiee e esteeesbeeeeeas 8
HEATINGES oottt e e e e et e e et e e e e rte e eenbae e e naaeeenraeeans 10
Committee ConsSideration .......c..ccoccieeieeiiiinieiiiienie ettt ettt ebe et e e 10
ComMITEEE VOLES ..oviiuiiiiiieiieiteeieetet ettt sttt ettt et sbe e e e 11
Statement of Oversight Findings and Recommendations of the Committee ...... 13
Statement of Performance Goals and Objectives .... 13
New Budget Authority and CBO Cost Estimate .. .13
Committee Cost Estimate ..o 19
Unfunded Mandate Statement .........c.ccoceeiiiiiiiiiieniiieieeieee et 19
AdVISOry COMMILEEE  ..viieeiieiiieiieiieeiieete ettt ettt ebe et esbeesteeesseessneebeessneenne 19
Application of Law to the Legislative Branch .........ccccccocoiviiiiiiniiniiiiiiiciene 19
Earmark Statement ... 19
Duplication of Federal Programs ........ccccocevereriieninienenieneneeseeesieeee e 20
Changes to EXIStING LaW ...ccceeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiie ettt eree e e e e e e ste e e seae e e 20

99-006



The amendment is as follows:
Strike all after the enacting clause and insert the following:

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Stronger Enforcement of Civil Penalties Act of
2019”.

SEC. 2. UPDATED CIVIL MONEY PENALTIES FOR SECURITIES LAWS VIOLATIONS.

(a) SECURITIES ACT OF 1933.—
(1) MONEY PENALTIES IN ADMINISTRATIVE ACTIONS.—Section 8A(g)(2) of the
Securities Act of 1933 (15 U.S.C. 77h-1(g)(2)) is amended—
(A) in subparagraph (A)—
(i) by striking “$7,500” and inserting “$10,000”; and
(ii) by striking “$75,000” and inserting “$100,000”;
(B) in subparagraph (B)—
(1) by striking “$75,000” and inserting “$100,000”; and
(ii) by striking “$375,000” and inserting “$500,000”; and
(C) by striking subparagraph (C) and inserting the following:
“(C) THIRD TIER.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A) and (B), for a
third tier act or omission, the amount of penalty for each such act or
omission shall not exceed the greater of—

“I) $1,000,000 for a natural person or $10,000,000 for any other
person;

“(II) 3 times the gross amount of pecuniary gain to the person
who committed the act or omission; or

“(III) the amount of losses incurred by victims as a result of the
act or omission.

“(i1) THIRD TIER ACT OR OMISSION.—For the purposes of this subpara-
graph, the term ‘third tier act or omission’ means an act or omission
described in paragraph (1) that—

“(I) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate or reckless
disregard of a regulatory requirement; and
“(II) directly or indirectly—
“(aa) resulted in substantial losses to other persons;
“(bb) created a significant risk of substantial losses to other
persons; or
“(cc) resulted in substantial pecuniary gain to the person
who committed the act or omission.”.
(2) MONEY PENALTIES IN CIVIL ACTIONS.—Section 20(d)(2) of the Securities Act
of 1933 (15 U.S.C. 77t(d)(2)) is amended—
(A) in subparagraph (A)—
(i) by striking “$5,000” and inserting “$10,000”; and
(ii) by striking “$50,000” and inserting “$100,000”;
(B) in subparagraph (B)—
(i) by striking “$50,000” and inserting “$100,000”; and
(ii) by striking “$250,000” and inserting “$500,000”; and
(C) by striking subparagraph (C) and inserting the following:
“(C) THIRD TIER.—

“i) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A) and (B), for a
third tier violation, the amount of penalty for each violation shall not
exceed the greater of—

“I) $1,000,000 for a natural person or $10,000,000 for any other
person;

“(II) 3 times the gross amount of pecuniary gain to the person
who committed the violation; or

“(III) the amount of losses incurred by victims as a result of the
violation.

“(i1) THIRD TIER VIOLATION.—For the purposes of this subparagraph,
‘(ch)e ‘frm ‘third tier violation’ means a violation described in paragraph

1) that—
“(I) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate or reckless
disregard of a regulatory requirement; and
“(II) directly or indirectly—
“(aa) resulted in substantial losses to other persons;
“(bb) created a significant risk of substantial losses to other
persons; or
“(cc) resulted in substantial pecuniary gain to the person
who committed the violation.”.



3

(b) SECURITIES EXCHANGE ACT OF 1934.—
(1) MONEY PENALTIES IN CIVIL ACTIONS.—Section 21(d)(3)(B) of the Securities
Exchange Act of 1934 (15 U.S.C. 78u(d)(3)(B)) is amended—
(A) in clause (i)—
(i) by striking “$5,000” and inserting “$10,000”; and
(ii) by striking “$50,000” and inserting “$100,000”;

(B) in clause (ii)—

(i) by striking “$50,000” and inserting “$100,000”; and

(ii) by striking “$250,000” and inserting “$500,000”; and
(C) by striking clause (iii) and inserting the following:

“(iii) THIRD TIER.—

“(I) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding clauses (i) and (ii), for a third
tier violation, the amount of penalty for each such violation shall
not exceed the greater of—

“(aa) $1,000,000 for a natural person or $10,000,000 for any
other person;

“(bb) 3 times the gross amount of pecuniary gain to the per-
son who committed the violation; or

“(cc) the amount of losses incurred by victims as a result of
the violation.

“(II) THIRD TIER VIOLATION.—For the purposes of this clause, the
term ‘third tier violation’ means a violation described in subpara-
graph (A) that—

“(aa) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate or
reckless disregard of a regulatory requirement; and
“(bb) directly or indirectly—
“(AA) resulted in substantial losses to other persons;
“(BB) created a significant risk of substantial losses to
other persons; or
“(CC) resulted in substantial pecuniary gain to the per-
son who committed the violation.”.
(2) MONEY PENALTIES IN ADMINISTRATIVE ACTIONS.—Section 21B(b) of the Se-
curities Exchange Act of 1934 (15 U.S.C. 78u—2(b)) is amended—
(A) in paragraph (1)—
(1) by striking “$5,000” and inserting “$10,000”; and
(ii) by striking “$50,000” and inserting “$100,000”;
(B) in paragraph (2)—
(1) by striking “$50,000” and inserting “$100,000”; and
(ii) by striking “$250,000” and inserting “$500,000”; and
(C) by striking paragraph (3) and inserting the following:
“(3) THIRD TIER.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding paragraphs (1) and (2), for a third
tier act or omission, the amount of penalty for each such act or omission
shall not exceed the greater of—

“(1) $1,000,000 for a natural person or $10,000,000 for any other per-
son;

“(i1) 3 times the gross amount of pecuniary gain to the person who
committed the act or omission; or

“(iii) the amount of losses incurred by victims as a result of the act
or omission.

“(B) THIRD TIER ACT OR OMISSION.—For the purposes of this paragraph,
the term ‘third tier act or omission’ means an act or omission described in
paragraph (1) that—

“(1) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate or reckless dis-
regard of a regulatory requirement; and
“@i1) directly or indirectly—

“(I) resulted in substantial losses to other persons;

“(II) created a significant risk of substantial losses to other per-
sons; or

“(IIT) resulted in substantial pecuniary gain to the person who
committed the act or omission.”.

(c) INVESTMENT COMPANY ACT OF 1940.—
(1) MONEY PENALTIES IN ADMINISTRATIVE ACTIONS.—Section 9(d)(2) of the In-
vestment Company Act of 1940 (15 U.S.C. 80a-9(d)(2)) is amended—

(A) in subparagraph (A)—

(1) by striking “$5,000” and inserting “$10,000”; and
(ii) by striking “$50,000” and inserting “$100,000”;

(B) in subparagraph (B)—

(i) by striking “$50,000” and inserting “$100,000”; and



4

(ii) by striking “$250,000” and inserting “$500,000”; and
(C) by striking subparagraph (C) and inserting the following:
“(C) THIRD TIER.—

“(i) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A) and (B), for a
third tier act or omission, the amount of penalty for each such act or
omission shall not exceed the greater of—

“I) $1,000,000 for a natural person or $10,000,000 for any other

erson;

“(II) 8 times the gross amount of pecuniary gain to the person
who committed the act or omission; or

“(III) the amount of losses incurred by victims as a result of the
act or omission.

“(i1) THIRD TIER ACT OR OMISSION.—For the purposes of this subpara-
graph, the term ‘third tier act or omission’ means an act or omission
described in paragraph (1) that—

“(I) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate or reckless
disregard of a regulatory requirement; and
“(II) directly or indirectly—
“(aa) resulted in substantial losses to other persons;
“(bb) created a significant risk of substantial losses to other
persons; or
“(cc) resulted in substantial pecuniary gain to the person
who committed the act or omission.”.
(2) MONEY PENALTIES IN CIVIL ACTIONS.—Section 42(e)(2) of the Investment
Company Act of 1940 (15 U.S.C. 80a—41(e)(2)) is amended—
(A) in subparagraph (A)—
(1) by striking “$5,000” and inserting “$10,000”; and
(ii) by striking “$50,000” and inserting “$100,000”;
(B) in subparagraph (B)—
(i) by striking “$50,000” and inserting “$100,000”; and
(ii) by striking “$250,000” and inserting “$500,000”; and
(C) by striking subparagraph (C) and inserting the following:
“(C) THIRD TIER.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A) and (B), for a
third tier violation, the amount of penalty for each such violation shall
not exceed the greater of—

“I) $1,000,000 for a natural person or $10,000,000 for any other
person;

“(II) 8 times the gross amount of pecuniary gain to the person
who committed the violation; or

“(III) the amount of losses incurred by victims as a result of the
violation.

“(i1) THIRD TIER VIOLATION.—For the purposes of this subparagraph,
the term ‘third tier violation’ means a violation described in paragraph
(1) that—

“(I) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate or reckless
disregard of a regulatory requirement; and
“(I1) directly or indirectly—
“(aa) resulted in substantial losses to other persons;
“(bb) created a significant risk of substantial losses to other
persons; or
“(cc) resulted in substantial pecuniary gain to the person
who committed the violation.”.
(d) INVESTMENT ADVISERS ACT OF 1940.—
(1) MONEY PENALTIES IN ADMINISTRATIVE ACTIONS.—Section 203(i)(2) of the
Investment Advisers Act of 1940 (15 U.S.C. 80b—3(1)(2)) is amended—
(A) in subparagraph (A)—
(i) by striking “$5,000” and inserting “$10,000”; and
(ii) by striking “$50,000” and inserting “$100,000”;
(B) in subparagraph (B)—
(i) by striking “$50,000” and inserting “$100,000”; and
(ii) by striking “$250,000” and inserting “$500,000”; and
(C) by striking subparagraph (C) and inserting the following:
“(C) THIRD TIER.—

“{i) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A) and (B), for a
third tier act or omission, the amount of penalty for each such act or
omission shall not exceed the greater of—

“I) $1,000,000 for a natural person or $10,000,000 for any other
person;



5

“(II) 3 times the gross amount of pecuniary gain to the person
who committed the act or omission; or

“(IIT) the amount of losses incurred by victims as a result of the
act or omission.

“(i1) THIRD TIER ACT OR OMISSION.—For the purposes of this subpara-
graph, the term ‘third tier act or omission’ means an act or omission
described in paragraph (1) that—

“(I) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate or reckless
disregard of a regulatory requirement; and
“(II) directly or indirectly—
“(aa) resulted in substantial losses to other persons;
“(bb) created a significant risk of substantial losses to other
persons; or
“(cc) resulted in substantial pecuniary gain to the person
who committed the act or omission.”.
(2) MONEY PENALTIES IN CIVIL ACTIONS.—Section 209(e)(2) of the Investment
Advisers Act of 1940 (15 U.S.C. 80b—9(e)(2)) is amended—
(A) in subparagraph (A)—
(i) by striking “$5,000” and inserting “$10,000”; and
(ii) by striking “$50,000” and inserting “$100,000”;
(B) in subparagraph (B)—
(i) by striking “$50,000” and inserting “$100,000”; and
(ii) by striking “$250,000” and inserting “$500,000”; and
(C) by striking subparagraph (C) and inserting the following:
“(C) THIRD TIER.—

“(i) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A) and (B), for a
third tier violation, the amount of penalty for each such violation shall
not exceed the greater of—

“I) $1,000,000 for a natural person or $10,000,000 for any other
person;

“(II) 38 times the gross amount of pecuniary gain to the person
who committed the violation; or

“(III) the amount of losses incurred by victims as a result of the
violation.

“(i1) THIRD TIER VIOLATION.—For the purposes of this subparagraph,
the 1};f>rm ‘third tier violation’ means a violation described in paragraph
(1) that—

“(I) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate or reckless
disregard of a regulatory requirement; and
“(II) directly or indirectly—
“(aa) resulted in substantial losses to other persons;
“(bb) created a significant risk of substantial losses to other
persons; or
“(cc) resulted in substantial pecuniary gain to the person
who committed the violation.”.

SEC. 3. PENALTIES FOR RECIDIVISTS.

(a) SECURITIES ACT OF 1933.—

(1) CEASE-AND-DESIST PROCEEDINGS.—Section 8A(g)(2) of the Securities Act of
1933 (15 U.S.C. 77h-1(g)(2)) is amended by adding at the end the following:

“(D) FourTH TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A), (B), and (C), the
maximum amount of penalty for each such act or omission shall be 3 times
the otherwise applicable amount in such subparagraphs if, within the 5-
year period preceding such act or omission, the person who committed the
act or omission was criminally convicted for securities fraud or became sub-
ject to a judgment or order imposing monetary, equitable, or administrative
relief in any Commission action alleging fraud by that person.”.

(2) INJUNCTIONS AND PROSECUTION OF OFFENSES.—Section 20(d)(2) of the Se-
curities Act of 1933 (15 U.S.C. 77t(d)(2)) is amended by adding at the end the
following:

“(D) FourTH TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A), (B), and (C), the
maximum amount of penalty for each such violation shall be 3 times the
otherwise applicable amount in such subparagraphs if, within the 5-year
period preceding such violation, the defendant was criminally convicted for
securities fraud or became subject to a judgment or order imposing mone-
tary, equitable, or administrative relief in any Commission action alleging
fraud by that defendant.”.

(b) SECURITIES EXCHANGE ACT OF 1934.—



6

(1) C1viL ACTIONS.—Section 21(d)(3)(B) of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934
(15 U.S.C. 78u(d)(3)(B)) is amended by adding at the end the following:

“(iv) FOURTH TIER.—Notwithstanding clauses (i), (ii), and (iii), the max-
imum amount of penalty for each such violation shall be 3 times the other-
wise applicable amount in such clauses if, within the 5-year period pre-
ceding such violation, the defendant was criminally convicted for securities
fraud or became subject to a judgment or order imposing monetary, equi-
table, or administrative relief in any Commission action alleging fraud by
that defendant.”.

(2) ADMINISTRATIVE PROCEEDINGS.—Section 21B(b) of the Securities Exchange
Act of 1934 (15 U.S.C. 78u—2(b)) is amended by adding at the end the following:

“(4) FourTH TIER.—Notwithstanding paragraphs (1), (2), and (3), the max-
imum amount of penalty for each such act or omission shall be 3 times the oth-
erwise applicable amount in such paragraphs if, within the 5-year period pre-
ceding such act or omission, the person who committed the act or omission was
criminally convicted for securities fraud or became subject to a judgment or
order imposing monetary, equitable, or administrative relief in any Commission
action alleging fraud by that person.”.

(c) INVESTMENT COMPANY ACT OF 1940.—

(1) INELIGIBILITY OF CERTAIN UNDERWRITERS AND AFFILIATES.—Section 9(d)(2)
of the Investment Company Act of 1940 (15 U.S.C. 80a-9(d)(2)) is amended by
adding at the end the following:

“(D) FourTH TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A), (B), and (C), the
maximum amount of penalty for each such act or omission shall be 3 times
the otherwise applicable amount in such subparagraphs if, within the 5-
year period preceding such act or omission, the person who committed the
act or omission was criminally convicted for securities fraud or became sub-
ject to a judgment or order imposing monetary, equitable, or administrative
relief in any Commission action alleging fraud by that person.”.

(2) ENFORCEMENT OF CERTAIN ACTIONS.—Section 42(e)(2) of the Investment
Company Act of 1940 (15 U.S.C. 80a—41(e)(2)) is amended by adding at the end
the following:

“(D) FourTH TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A), (B), and (C), the
maximum amount of penalty for each such violation shall be 3 times the
otherwise applicable amount in such subparagraphs if, within the 5-year
period preceding such violation, the defendant was criminally convicted for
securities fraud or became subject to a judgment or order imposing mone-
tary, equitable, or administrative relief in any Commission action alleging
fraud by that defendant.”.

(d) INVESTMENT ADVISERS ACT OF 1940.—The Investment Advisers Act of 1940 (15
U.S.C. 80b-1 et seq.) is amended—
. (1) in section 203(i)(2) (15 U.S.C. 80b-3(i)(2)), by adding at the end the fol-
owing:

“(D) FourTH TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A), (B), and (C), the
maximum amount of penalty for each such act or omission shall be 3 times
the otherwise applicable amount in such subparagraphs if, within the 5-
year period preceding such act or omission, the person who committed the
act or omission was criminally convicted for securities fraud or became sub-
ject to a judgment or order imposing monetary, equitable, or administrative
relief in any Commission action alleging fraud by that person.”; and

. (2) in section 209(e)(2) (15 U.S.C. 80b-9(e)(2)) by adding at the end the fol-
owing:

“(D) FourTH TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A), (B), and (C), the
maximum amount of penalty for each such violation shall be 3 times the
otherwise applicable amount in such subparagraphs if, within the 5-year
period preceding such violation, the defendant was criminally convicted for
securities fraud or became subject to a judgment or order imposing mone-
tary, equitable, or administrative relief in any Commission action alleging
fraud by that defendant.”.

SEC. 4. VIOLATIONS OF INJUNCTIONS AND BARS.
(a) SECURITIES ACT OF 1933.—Section 20(d) of the Securities Act of 1933 (15
U.S.C. 77t(d)) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (1), by inserting after “the rules or regulations thereunder,”
the following: “a Federal court injunction or a bar obtained or entered by the
Commission under this title,”; and

(2) by striking paragraph (4) and inserting the following:

“(4) SPECIAL PROVISIONS RELATING TO A VIOLATION OF AN INJUNCTION OR CER-
TAIN ORDERS.—



7

“(A) IN GENERAL.—Each separate violation of an injunction or order de-
scribed in subparagraph (B) shall be a separate offense, except that in the
case of a violation through a continuing failure to comply with such injunc-
tion or order, each day of the failure to comply with the injunction or order
shall be deemed a separate offense.

“(B) INJUNCTIONS AND ORDERS.—Subparagraph (A) shall apply with re-
spect to any action to enforce—

“(i) a Federal court injunction obtained pursuant to this title;

“(ii) an order entered or obtained by the Commission pursuant to this
title that bars, suspends, places limitations on the activities or func-
tions of, or prohibits the activities of a person; or

“(iii) a cease-and-desist order entered by the Commission pursuant to
section 8A.”.

(b) SECURITIES EXCHANGE AcCT OF 1934.—Section 21(d)(3) of the Securities Ex-
change Act of 1934 (15 U.S.C. 78u(d)(3)) is amended—

(1) in subparagraph (A), by inserting after “the rules or regulations there-
under,” the following: “a Federal court injunction or a bar obtained or entered
by the Commission under this title,”; and

(2) by striking subparagraph (D) and inserting the following:

“(D) SPECIAL PROVISIONS RELATING TO A VIOLATION OF AN INJUNCTION OR CER-
TAIN ORDERS.—

“(i) IN GENERAL.—Each separate violation of an injunction or order de-
scribed in clause (ii) shall be a separate offense, except that in the case of
a violation through a continuing failure to comply with such injunction or
order, each day of the failure to comply with the injunction or order shall
be deemed a separate offense.

“(i1) INJUNCTIONS AND ORDERS.—Clause (i) shall apply with respect to an
action to enforce—

“(I) a Federal court injunction obtained pursuant to this title;

“(II) an order entered or obtained by the Commission pursuant to
this title that bars, suspends, places limitations on the activities or
functions of, or prohibits the activities of a person; or

“(III) a cease-and-desist order entered by the Commission pursuant
to section 21C.”.

(¢c) INVESTMENT COMPANY ACT OF 1940.—Section 42(e) of the Investment Com-
pany Act of 1940 (15 U.S.C. 80a—41(e)) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (1), by inserting after “the rules or regulations thereunder,”
the following: “a Federal court injunction or a bar obtained or entered by the
Commission under this title,”; and

(2) by striking paragraph (4) and inserting the following:

“(4) SPECIAL PROVISIONS RELATING TO A VIOLATION OF AN INJUNCTION OR CER-
TAIN ORDERS.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—Each separate violation of an injunction or order de-
scribed in subparagraph (B) shall be a separate offense, except that in the
case of a violation through a continuing failure to comply with such injunc-
tion or order, each day of the failure to comply with the injunction or order
shall be deemed a separate offense.

“(B) INJUNCTIONS AND ORDERS.—Subparagraph (A) shall apply with re-
spect to any action to enforce—

“(i) a Federal court injunction obtained pursuant to this title;

“(i1) an order entered or obtained by the Commission pursuant to this
title that bars, suspends, places limitations on the activities or func-
tions of, or prohibits the activities of a person; or

“(iii) a cease-and-desist order entered by the Commission pursuant to
section 9(f).”.

(d) INVESTMENT ADVISERS ACT OF 1940.—Section 209(e) of the Investment Advis-
ers Act of 1940 (15 U.S.C. 80b—9(e)) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (1), by inserting after “the rules or regulations thereunder,”
the following: “a Federal court injunction or a bar obtained or entered by the
Commission under this title,”; and

(2) by striking paragraph (4) and inserting the following:

“(4) SPECIAL PROVISIONS RELATING TO A VIOLATION OF AN INJUNCTION OR CER-
TAIN ORDERS.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—Each separate violation of an injunction or order de-
scribed in subparagraph (B) shall be a separate offense, except that in the
case of a violation through a continuing failure to comply with such injunc-
tion or order, each day of the failure to comply with the injunction or order
shall be deemed a separate offense.



8

“(B) INJUNCTIONS AND ORDERS.—Subparagraph (A) shall apply with re-
spect to any action to enforce—

“(i) a Federal court injunction obtained pursuant to this title;

“(i1) an order entered or obtained by the Commission pursuant to this
title that bars, suspends, places limitations on the activities or func-
tions of, or prohibits the activities of a person; or

“(iii) a cease-and-desist order entered by the Commission pursuant to
section 203(k).”.

PURPOSE AND SUMMARY

On July 9, 2019, Representative Katie Porter introduced H.R.
3641, the Stronger Enforcement of Civil Penalties Act, which would
increase the SEC’s statutory limits on civil monetary penalties; di-
rectly link the size of these penalties to the scope of harm and asso-
ciated investor losses; and substantially raise the financial stakes
for repeat securities law violators.

BACKGROUND AND NEED FOR LEGISLATION

Specifically, the bill would increase the per-violation cap applica-
ble to the most serious securities laws violations from $181,071 to
$1 million per violation for individuals, and from $905,353 to $10
million per violation for entities. It would also triple the penalty
cap for recidivists who have been held criminally or civilly liable
for securities fraud within the preceding five years. The SEC would
be able to assess these types of penalties through administrative
action, and not just in federal court.

H.R. 3641 would increase the deterrence of these civil penalties
through the increases in penalties provided for in this Act. When
Congress passed legislation indexing the original civil penalty
amounts to inflation in 1990, the S&P 500 had a value of $303.23.
Although the S&P 500 is currently valued over $3,100, or 10 times
the amount in 1990, the underlying penalty amounts have not been
changed and thus have failed to keep up with the rate and mag-
nitude of our financial markets and of financial misconduct (al-
though certain penalties have increased because they are indexed
to inflation). The current penalty amounts do not reflect these new
market realities and so do not adequately deter or penalize bad ac-
tors. Instead, many actors sees these fines as a cost of doing busi-
ness and a necessary expense for maximizing financial gains.

This increased authority is consistent with that requested by
former SEC Chair Schapiro and agreed to by former SEC Chair
White.! This bill is similar to a bipartisan bill in the Senate (S.
779) and a modest increase to a provision in former Chairman
Hensarling’s CHOICE Act from the 115th Congress (Section 211 of
H.R. 10). This bill is supported by North American Securities Ad-
ministrators Association (NASAA) and Public Citizen.

SECTION-BY-SECTION ANALYSIS

Section 1. Short title

This section states that the title of the bill is the Stronger En-
forcement of Civil Penalties Act of 2019.

1Letter from SEC Chairman Mary Schapiro to Senator Jack Reed re: SEC Penalty Authority
(Nov. 28, 2011), available at http:/www.davispolk.com/files/uploads/IMG/Mary-Schapiro--Letter-
to-Senator-Jack-Reed.pdf.



9

Section 2. Updated civil money penalties for securities laws viola-
tions

This section increased penalties in a like manner for the Securi-
ties Act of 1933, the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, the Invest-
ment Company Act of 1940 and the Investor Advisers Act of 1940.

Subsection (a) of Section 2 amends the Securities Act of 1933:

Paragraph (1) of subsection (a) amends Section 8A(g)(2) the Secu-
rities Act of 1933 (relating to cease and desist orders) to increase
penalties in administrative actions:

Subparagraph (A) amends section 8A(g)(2)(A) by striking
“$7,500” and inserting “$10,000” and by striking “$75,000” and in-
serting “$100,000”, increasing the penalty amounts for natural and
other persons, respectively, for first tier penalties.

Subparagraph (B) amends section 8A(g)(2)(B) by striking
“$75,000” and inserting $100,000” and by striking “$375,000” and
inserting “$500,000”, increasing the penalty amounts for natural
and other persons respectively for second tier penalties (where the
act or omission involved fraud, deceit, manipulation or deliberate
or reckless disregard of a regulatory requirement).

Subparagraph (C) amends section 8A(g)(2)(C) and limits the
amount of the penalty to: $1,000,000 for a natural person or
$10,000,000 for any other person; 3 times the gross amount of pe-
cuniary gain to the person who committed the act or omission; or
the amount of losses incurred by victims as a result of the act or
omission, for third tier penalties (where the act or omission in-
volved fraud, deceit, manipulation or deliberate or reckless dis-
regard of a regulatory requirement and the act or omission directly
or indirectly resulted in a substantial losses to other persons, cre-
ated a significant risk of substantial losses to other persons, or re-
sulted in substantial pecuniary gain to the person who committed
the act or omission).

Paragraph (2) of Subsection (a) amends Section 20(d)(2) of the
Securities Act of 1933 (relating to injunctions and civil actions).

Subparagraph (A) amends section 20(d)(2)(A) by: striking
“$5,000” and inserting “$10,000” and by striking “$50,000” and in-
serting “$100,000”, increasing the penalty amounts for natural and
other persons, respectively, for first tier penalties

Subparagraph (B) amends section 20(d)(2)(B) by striking
“$50,000” and inserting “$100,000”; and 12 by striking “$250,000”
and inserting “$500,000” increasing the penalty amounts for nat-
ural and other persons, respectively, for second tier penalties

Subparagraph (C): amends section 20(d)(2)(C) by revising the
penalties for third tier violations to be no greater than $1,000,000
for a natural person or $10,000,000 for any other person; 3 times
the gross amount of pecuniary gain to the person who committed
the violation; or the amount of losses incurred by the victim as a
result of the violation, for third tier penalties.

Subsection (b) of section 2 amends section 21(d)(3)(B) and section
21B(b) of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934: The amendments
are similar to the amendments made to the Securities Act of 1933,
amending the penalties for tier one, two and three offenses in the
same manner as subsection (a) amends the Securities Act of 1933.

Subsection (¢) of Section 2 amends section 9(d)(2) and 42(e)(2) of
the Investment Company Act of 1940: The amendments are similar
to the amendments made to the Securities Act of 1933, amending



10

the penalties for tier one, two and three offenses in the same man-
ner as subsection (a) amends the Securities Act of 1933.

Subsection (d) of Section 2 amends section 203(1)(2) and 209(e)(2)
of the Investment Advisors Act of 1940. The amendments are simi-
lar to the amendments made to the Securities Act of 1933, amend-
ing the penalties for tier one, two and three offenses in the same
manner as subsection (a) amends the Securities Act of 1933.

Section 3. Penalties for recidivists

Section 3 amends sections 8A(g)(2) and 20(d)(2) of the Securities
Act of 1933; sections 21(d)(3)(B) and 21B(b) of the Securities Ex-
change Act of 1934; sections 9(d)(2) of the Investment Company Act
of 1940; sections 42(e)(2) of the Investment Company Act of 1940;
and sections 203(1)(2) and sections 209(e)(2) of the Investment Ad-
visers Act of 1940 to add a fourth tier to each provision. The new
fourth tier provides for a maximum penalty in an amount equal to
3 times the otherwise applicable amount if the person within the
5-year period preceding the violation or omission was criminally
convicted for securities fraud or became subject to a judgment or
order imposing monetary, equitable, or administrative relief in any
Commission action alleging fraud by that person.

Section 4. Violations of injunctions and bars

Section 4 amends section 20(d) of the Securities Act of 1933; sec-
tion 21(d)(3) of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934; Section 42(e)
of the Investment Company Act of 1940; and section 209(e) of the
Investment Advisers Act of 1940 to add a fourth tier, which explic-
itly requires in each provision that each separate violation of an in-
junction order is to be considered a separate offense and that in-
junctions and orders shall apply to any action to enforce a federal
court injunction, an order entered or obtained by the Commission,
or a cease-and-desist order entered by the Commission.

HEARINGS

For the purposes of section 103(i) of H. Res. 6 for the 116th Con-
gress, the Committee on Financial Services’ Subcommittee on In-
vestor Protection, Entrepreneurship, and Capital Markets held a
hearing to consider H.R. 3641 entitled, “Putting Investors First:
Examining Proposals to Strengthen Enforcement Against Securi-
ties Law Violators” on June 19, 2019. Testifying before the Com-
mittee was Jordan A. Thomas, Partner, Labaton Sucharow; Urska
Velikonja, Professor of Law, Georgetown University Law Center;
Andrew N. Vollmer, Professor of Law, University of Virginia School
of Law; and Stephen Crimmins, Partner, Murphy & McGonigle,
PC.

COMMITTEE CONSIDERATION

The Committee on Financial Services met in open session on,
and ordered H.R. 3641 to be reported favorably to the House with
an amendment in the nature of a substitute by a vote of 33 yeas
and 25 nays, a quorum being present.



11

COMMITTEE VOTES AND ROLL CALL VOTES

In compliance with clause 3(b) of rule XIII of the Rules of the
House of Representatives, the Committee advises that the following

roll call votes occurred during the Committee’s consideration of
H.R. 3641:



12

Present

Representatives

Ayes

Nays

Ms. Waters, Chairwoman

Mus, Maloney

Ms. Veldzquez

Mr. Sherman

Mr. Meeks

Mr. Clay

Mr, Scott

Mr. Green

Mr, Cleaver

Mr. Perlmutter

Mr. Himes

Mr. Foster

Mrs. Beatty

Ea3 Pt P B B e e B P e P

Mr. Heck

Mr. Vargas

Mr. Gottheimer

Mr. Gonzalez (TX)

M. Lawson

Mr. San Nicolas

Ms. Tlaib

Ms. Porter

Ms. Axne

Mr. Casten

Ms. Pressley

Mr, McAdams

Ms. Ocasio-Cortez

Ms. Wexton

Mr. Lynch

Ms. Gabbard

Ms. Adams

Ms. Dean

Mr. Garcia (iL)

Ms. Gareia (TX)

Mr. Phillips

ES ERE EIEAEI R P BRI B B B B 53 BT B B B P B

34

Mr. McHenry, Ranking Member

ES

Ms. Wagner

B

Mr. King

kS

Committee on Financial Services
Full Committee
116th Congress (Ist Session)

Date: 1612019

Measure __ HR 3641

g No.

Offered by: Rep. Porter {as amended)

Mr. Lucas

bl

Mr. Posey

=

Mr, Luetkemeyer

=

M. Huizenga

"

Agreed  |Yes No Prsat Wdrm

To

M. Duffy

B

Mr. Stivers

Mr. Barr

Mr. Tipton

I it B

Voice Ayes Nays
Vote

Mr, Williams

Mr. Hill

Mr. Emmer

ld B

Mr. Zeldin

Mr. Loudermilk

Mr. Mooney

Mr. Davidson

Record FC
Vote

33-28

Mr. Budd

Mr. Kustoft

F B s B P B

Mr, Hollingsworth

Mr. Gonzalez (OH)

=

Mr. Rose

Mr. Steil

Mr. Gooden

Mr. Riggleman

S 2 =

26




13

STATEMENT OF OVERSIGHT FINDINGS AND RECOMMENDATIONS OF
THE COMMITTEE

In compliance with clause 3(c)(1) of rule XIII and clause 2(b)(1)
of rule X of the Rules of the House of Representatives, the Commit-
tee’s oversight findings and recommendations are reflected in the
descriptive portions of this report.

STATEMENT OF PERFORMANCE GOALS AND OBJECTIVES

Pursuant to clause (3)(¢) of rule XIII of the Rules of the House
of Representatives, the goals of H.R. 3641 are to increase civil pen-
alties for violations of the relevant acts amendment by H.R. 3641
to deter violations of those statutes.

NEW BUDGET AUTHORITY AND CBO COST ESTIMATE

Pursuant to clause 3(c)(2) of rule XIII of the Rules of the House
of Representatives and section 308(a) of the Congressional Budget
Act of 1974, and pursuant to clause 3(c)(3) of rule XIII of the Rules
of the House of Representatives and section 402 of the Congres-
sional Budget Act of 1974, the Committee has received the fol-
lowing estimate for H.R. 3641 from the Director of the Congres-
sional Budget Office:

U.S. CONGRESS,
CONGRESSIONAL BUDGET OFFICE,
Washington, DC, February 20, 2020.
Hon. MAXINE WATERS,
Chairwoman, Committee on Financial Services,
House of Representatives, Washington, DC.

DEAR MADAM CHAIRWOMAN: The Congressional Budget Office
has prepared the enclosed cost estimate for H.R. 3641, the Stronger
Enforcement of Civil Penalties Act of 2019.

If you wish further details on this estimate, we will be pleased
to provide them. The CBO staff contact is Nathaniel Frentz.

Sincerely,
MARK P. HADLEY
(For Phillip L. Swagel, Director).

Enclosure.



14

o by the House Committes on

By Fiscal Year, Millions of Dollars 2020 2020-2025 2020-2030

Direct Spending (Outlays) 40 960 2,060
Revenues 185 4,635 9,260
increase or Decrease (-}

in the Deficit ~145 -3,675 -7,200
Spending Subject to * * *

Appropriation (Outlays)
Statutory pay-asyotego
pmgedgyes apply?

Increases on-budget deficits in any.
of the four consecutive 10-year
_periods beginning i 20317

governmental mandate?

Ves, Under
. Thresho

Contains private-ssctor mandate?

= between -$500,000 and $500,000.

The bill would
« Increase the amount of civil monetary penalties the Securities and Exchange Commission (SEC) may order
in certain judicial and administrative enforcement actions
» Raise the cost of an existing mandate on private entities required fo pay assessments to the SEC

Estimated budgetary effects would primarily stem from
» Increased collections of civil monetary penalties and distributions to harmed investors
e increased payments to whistleblowers

Areas of significant uncertainty include
s Predicting the amount of penalties that the SEC orders, collects, and distributes under current law and how
those collections and related spending would change under the bill
« Estimating the amount and timing of payments to whistleblowers

Detailed estimate begins on the next page.

Bill summary: H.R. 3641 would increase the maximum civil mon-
etary penalties that the Securities and Exchange Commission
(SEC) may order against individuals and companies that violate
certain securities laws or regulations. In addition to increasing the
specific penalty amounts, the bill would give the SEC the author-
ity, in the case of certain serious violations, to order penalties
equal to three times the pecuniary gain to the violator or equal to
the amount of losses incurred by the victims. H.R. 3641 would per-
mit the SEC to further compound certain penalties ordered against
repeat violators.

Estimated Federal cost: The estimated budgetary effect of H.R.
3641 is shown in Table 1. The costs of the legislation fall within
budget function 370 (commerce and housing credit).




15

*3|q131138u aq pinom Suipuads Aieuoi3aiasip ul a3ueyd Aue jeyy sejewliss 0go ‘Aouine eyl ypum Jualsisuod suoioe uorjendosdde Suiwnssy uonendosdde [enuue Sy J8sp0 0} Jeak Yyaea sas) 19909 0} paziioy}
-ne S| 93 Ay} ‘UBAAMOH ‘TF9E "Y'H Jepun Su013ds)|0d A}jeuad pasesalau) ay} $sa20id pue 399|[09 0} junowe juedludisul ue Aq (93S) uoISSIWILWOY SSUBYIXT PUB SIHINIBS BY} J0} SIS0D 3Seadul pinod |1q a8y} Sunuawsjdwi jey} sjoadxe 0go

00¢'L,—  §9¢— GO0L— G0L— S0L— GOL— G0L— SOL— GOL— GOL— OWL— G9— GHI— H01}3Q 3y} uo Jo343
Sulpuadg 0a11Q pue sanuanay ul sagueysy woi4
12148(Q 8y} Ul 8sealoaq JaN

090 096 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 0¢e 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 0¢¢ G681 A or skeinQ pajews3
090 096 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 681 A oy fuoyiny 1a3png pajewns]
3uipuadg 10811q Ul Sasealou|

0926 GE9'y Ge6 Ge6 Ge6 Ge6 Geb Ge6 Ge6 Geb Ge6 06/ 681 Sanuanay pajewnisy
SaNUBAJY Ul Sasealau|

0€02-020¢  5202-0¢0¢ 0€0¢ 620¢ 820¢ L20¢ 920¢ G20¢ 20¢ €20¢ ¢20¢ 1e0¢ 020¢

—SJe|jop Jo suoljjiw ‘1eak [easly Ag

T¥9€ "¥'H 40 S133443 A¥Y139ANG Q3LYINILSI—'T 18Vl



16

Basis of estimate: CBO assumes that H.R. 3641 will be enacted
in 2020.

Revenues: H.R. 3641 would increase the maximum civil mone-
tary penalties the SEC could seek for certain violations. Under cur-
rent law, those amounts range from $5,000 to $1 million, depend-
ing on such factors as the type and severity of the violation and
whether the violator is an individual or business. For some viola-
tions, the SEC may use a federal court action to seek a penalty
equal to the gross amount of the pecuniary gain to the violator, if
{:hat amount is greater than the maximum amount enumerated in
aw.

H.R. 3641 would increase the maximum amounts for civil mone-
tary penalties. Under the bill, those amounts would range from
$10,000 for lesser violations to $10 million for more serious viola-
tions. In certain cases, the bill also would give the SEC the author-
ity to order penalties equal to three times the pecuniary gain to the
violator or equal to the amount of losses incurred by the victim.
H.R. 3641 would permit the SEC to further compound penalties or-
dered against repeat violators.

CBO treats collections of civil monetary penalties as revenues in
the federal budget. Using data from the SEC about enforcement ac-
tions in recent years, CBO estimates that enacting H.R. 3641
would increase the collection of civil monetary penalties, and thus
revenues, by about $9.3 billion over the 2020-2030 period.

Direct spending: Section 308 of the Sarbanes-Oxley Act, known
as the Fair Fund provision, authorizes the SEC to distribute civil
monetary penalties to harmed investors. For this cost estimate,
CBO has displayed distributions of additional revenues as direct
spending. Based on distribution patterns from enforcement actions
in recent years, CBO estimates that H.R. 3641 would increase out-
lays by about $1.6 billion over the 2020-2030 period.

In addition, the SEC provides monetary awards to whistle-
blowers who report violations that lead to judicial or administrative
enforcement actions yielding more than $1 million in penalties.
Whistleblowers are eligible to receive between 10 percent and 30
percent of any penalties ordered and collected. Because civil mone-
tary penalties would increase under H.R. 3641, CBO expects that
whistleblower awards would increase proportionally. CBO esti-
mates that the SEC would pay $440 million in additional whistle-
blower awards over the 2020-2030 period. Such awards are re-
corded as direct spending in the federal budget.

In total, CBO expects that enacting H.R. 3641 would increase di-
rect spending by about $2.1 billion over the 2020-2030 period.

Uncertainty: Because the amount of penalties that the SEC or-
ders, collects, and distributes from securities law violations is hard
to predict and varies from year to year, estimating the budgetary
effects of H.R. 3641 is uncertain; collections could be larger or
smaller than CBO estimates. Several other factors also could affect
the estimated change in revenues under the bill, including how fre-
quently the SEC would seek the new maximum penalties, how
much those larger penalties would deter violators, whether the
higher amounts would affect the SEC’s collection rates, and how
much the SEC would return to harmed investors. In addition, be-
cause the amount and timing of payments to whistleblowers de-
pends on factors such as the number of whistleblowers and the size



17

of awards each year, all of which are hard to predict, the total
amounts could be larger or smaller than CBO estimates.

Pay-As-You-Go considerations: The Statutory Pay-As-You-Go Act
of 2010 establishes budget-reporting and enforcement procedures
for legislation affecting direct spending or revenues. The net
changes in outlays and revenues that are subject to those pay-as-
you-go procedures are shown in Table 2.



18

092'6 GE9'y Ge6 Ge6 Ge6 Ge6 Ge6 Ge6 Ge6 Geb Ge6 (74 681 sanuanay ul sasuey)

090 096 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 0¢¢ 681 5L oy skepng u saguey)
‘wnpuelowsy

00'L—  G9¢— S0L— SOL— GOL— GOL— S0L— SOL— SOL— SOL— OWL— S9— SHI— 10843 09-noA-sy-Aed

191)3Q 8y} Ul 9se3193(Q BN

0€0¢-020¢ 52020202 0€0¢ 620¢ 820¢ Le0e 920¢ §20¢ 20¢ €20¢ ¢20¢ 1e0¢ 020¢

—sSJe||op Jo suol|iw ‘1eak |easly Ag

6102 ‘9T AINM NO SIDIAYIS TYIONYNIA NO FILLIWWOD ISNOH IHL A9 AIL¥04FY 4I¥IAY0
SV ‘6102 40 LV SIILTYNId TIAID 40 INFWIDYOINT ¥IDNOHLS IHL ‘T¥9E "¥'H 40 SLIF443 09-N0A-SY-AVd AYOLNLYLS FHL 40 ILYWILST S.090—C TVl



19

Increase in long-term deficits: None.

Mandates: If the SEC increased fees to offset the costs associated
with implementing the bill, H.R. 3641 would increase the cost of
an existing mandate on private entities required to pay those as-
sessments. CBO estimates that the incremental cost of the man-
date would be below the annual threshold established in the Un-
funded Mandates Reform Act (UMRA) for private-sector mandates
($168 million in 2020, adjusted annually for inflation).

The bill contains no intergovernmental mandates as defined in
UMRA.

Estimate prepared by revenues: Nathaniel Frentz; Direct Spend-
ing: David Hughes; Mandates: Rachel Austin.

Estimate reviewed by: Joshua Shakin, Chief, Revenue Esti-
mating Unit; John McClelland, Director of Tax Analysis; Susan
Willie, Chief, Public and Private Mandates Unit; Kim Cawley,
Chief, Natural and Physical Resources Cost Estimates Unit; H.
Samuel Papenfuss, Deputy Director of Budget Analysis; Theresa
Gullo, Director of Budget Analysis.

COMMITTEE COST ESTIMATE

Clause 3(d)(1) of rule XIII of the Rules of the House of Rep-
resentatives requires an estimate and a comparison of the costs
that would be incurred in carrying out H.R. 3641. However, clause
3(d)(2)(B) of that rule provides that this requirement does not
apply when the committee has included in its report a timely sub-
mitted cost estimate of the bill prepared by the Director of the Con-
gressional Budget Office under section 402 of the Congressional
Budget Act.

UNFUNDED MANDATE STATEMENT

Pursuant to Section 423 of the Congressional Budget and Im-
poundment Control Act (as amended by Section 101(a)(2) of the Un-
funded Mandates Reform Act, Pub. L. 104-4), the Committee
adopts as its own the estimate of federal mandates regarding H.R.
362, as amended, prepared by the Director of the Congressional
Budget Office.

ADVISORY COMMITTEE

No advisory committees within the meaning of section 5(b) of the
Federal Advisory Committee Act were created by this legislation.

APPLICATION OF LAW TO THE LEGISLATIVE BRANCH

Pursuant to section 102(b)(3) of the Congressional Accountability
Act, Pub. L. No. 104-1, H.R. 3641, as amended, does not apply to
terms and conditions of employment or to access to public services
or accommodations within the legislative branch.

EARMARK STATEMENT

In accordance with clause 9 of rule XXI of the Rules of the House
of Representatives, H.R. 3641 does not contain any congressional
earmarks, limited tax benefits, or limited tariff benefits as de-
scribed in clauses 9(e), 9(f), and 9(g) of rule XXI.



20

DUPLICATION OF FEDERAL PROGRAMS

Pursuant to clause 3(c)(5) of rule XIII of the Rules of the House
of Representatives, the Committee states that no provision of H.R.
3641 establishes or reauthorizes a program of the Federal Govern-
ment known to be duplicative of another federal program, a pro-
gram that was included in any report from the Government Ac-
countability Office to Congress pursuant to section 21 of Public
Law 111-139, or a program related to a program identified in the
most recent Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance.

CHANGES TO EXISTING LAaw

In compliance with clause 3(e) of rule XIII of the Rules of the
House of Representatives, changes in existing law made by the bill,
H.R. 3641, as reported, are shown as follows:

CHANGES IN EXISTING LAW MADE BY THE BILL, AS REPORTED

In compliance with clause 3(e) of rule XIII of the Rules of the
House of Representatives, changes in existing law made by the bill,
as reported, are shown as follows (existing law proposed to be omit-
ted is enclosed in black brackets, new matter is printed in italics,
and existing law in which no change is proposed is shown in
roman):

SECURITIES ACT OF 1933
TITLE I—

* * & * * * *

CEASE-AND-DESIST PROCEEDINGS

SEC. 8A. (a) AUTHORITY OF THE COMMISSION.—If the Commission
finds, after notice and opportunity for hearing, that any person is
violating, has violated, or is about to violate any provision of this
title, or any rule or regulation thereunder, the Commission may
publish its findings and enter an order requiring such person, and
any other person that is, was, or would be a cause of the violation,
due to an act or omission the person knew or should have known
would contribute to such violation, to cease and desist from com-
mitting or causing such violation and any future violation of the
same provision, rule, or regulation. Such order may, in addition to
requiring a person to cease and desist from committing or causing
a violation, require such person to comply, or to take steps to effect
compliance, with such provision, rule, or regulation, upon such
terms and conditions and within such time as the Commission may
specify in such order. Any such order may, as the Commission
deems appropriate, require future compliance or steps to effect fu-
ture compliance, either permanently or for such period of time as
the Commission may specify, with such provision, rule, or regula-
tion with respect to any security, any issuer, or any other person.

(b) HEARING.—The notice instituting proceedings pursuant to
subsection (a) shall fix a hearing date not earlier than 30 days nor
later than 60 days after service of the notice unless an earlier or
a later date is set by the Commission with the consent of any re-
spondent so served.



21

(c) TEMPORARY ORDER.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Whenever the Commission determines that
the alleged violation or threatened violation specified in the no-
tice instituting proceedings pursuant to subsection (a), or the
continuation thereof, is likely to result in significant dissipa-
tion or conversion of assets, significant harm to investors, or
substantial harm to the public interest, including, but not lim-
ited to, losses to the Securities Investor Protection Corporation,
prior to the completion of the proceedings, the Commission
may enter a temporary order requiring the respondent to cease
and desist from the violation or threatened violation and to
take such action to prevent the violation or threatened viola-
tion and to prevent dissipation or conversion of assets, signifi-
cant harm to investors, or substantial harm to the public inter-
est as the Commission deems appropriate pending completion
of such proceeding. Such an order shall be entered only after
notice and opportunity for a hearing, unless the Commission
determines that notice and hearing prior to entry would be im-
practicable or contrary to the public interest. A temporary
order shall become effective upon service upon the respondent
and, unless set aside, limited, or suspended by the Commission
or a court of competent jurisdiction, shall remain effective and
enforceable pending the completion of the proceedings.

(2) ApPPLICABILITY.—This subsection shall apply only to a re-
spondent that acts, or, at the time of the alleged misconduct
acted, as a broker, dealer, investment adviser, investment com-
pany, municipal securities dealer, government securities
broker, government securities dealer, or transfer agent, or is,
or was at the time of the alleged misconduct, an associated
person of, or a person seeking to become associated with, any
of the foregoing.

(d) REVIEW OF TEMPORARY ORDERS.—

(1) COMMISSION REVIEW.—At any time after the respondent
has been served with a temporary cease-and-desist order pur-
suant to subsection (c¢), the respondent may apply to the Com-
mission to have the order set aside, limited, or suspended. If
the respondent has been served with a temporary cease-and-
desist order entered without a prior Commission hearing, the
respondent may, within 10 days after the date on which the
order was served, request a hearing on such application and
the Commission shall hold a hearing and render a decision on
such application at the earliest possible time.

(2) JuDICIAL REVIEW.—Within—

(A) 10 days after the date the respondent was served
with a temporary cease-and-desist order entered with a
prior Commission hearing, or
(B) 10 days after the Commission renders a decision on
an application and hearing under paragraph (1), with re-
spect to any temporary cease-and-desist order entered
without a prior Commission hearing,
the respondent may apply to the United States district court
for the district in which the respondent resides or has its prin-
cipal place of business, or for the District of Columbia, for an
order setting aside, limiting, or suspending the effectiveness or
enforcement of the order, and the court shall have jurisdiction



22

to enter such an order. A respondent served with a temporary
cease-and-desist order entered without a prior Commission
hearing may not apply to the court except after hearing and
decision by the Commission on the respondent’s application
under paragraph (1) of this subsection.

(3) NO AUTOMATIC STAY OF TEMPORARY ORDER.—The com-
mencement of proceedings under paragraph (2) of this sub-
section shall not, unless specifically ordered by the court, oper-
ate as a stay of the Commission’s order.

(4) EXCLUSIVE REVIEW.—Section 9(a) of this title shall not
apply to a temporary order entered pursuant to this section.

(e) AUTHORITY To ENTER AN ORDER REQUIRING AN ACCOUNTING
AND DISGORGEMENT.—In any cease-and-desist proceeding under
subsection (a), the Commission may enter an order requiring ac-
counting and disgorgement, including reasonable interest. The
Commission is authorized to adopt rules, regulations, and orders
concerning payments to investors, rates of interest, periods of ac-
crual, and such other matters as it deems appropriate to imple-
ment this subsection.

(f) AUTHORITY OF THE COMMISSION TO PROHIBIT PERSONS FrROM
SERVING AS OFFICERS OR DIRECTORS.—In any cease-and-desist pro-
ceeding under subsection (a), the Commission may issue an order
to prohibit, conditionally or unconditionally, and permanently or
for such period of time as it shall determine, any person who has
violated section 17(a)(1) or the rules or regulations thereunder,
from acting as an officer or director of any issuer that has a class
of securities registered pursuant to section 12 of the Securities Ex-
change Act of 1934, or that is required to file reports pursuant to
section 15(d) of that Act, if the conduct of that person demonstrates
unfitness to serve as an officer or director of any such issuer.

(g) AUTHORITY TO IMPOSE MONEY PENALTIES.—

(1) GROUNDS.—In any cease-and-desist proceeding under
subsection (a), the Commission may impose a civil penalty on
a person if the Commission finds, on the record, after notice
and opportunity for hearing, that—

(A) such person—

(i) is violating or has violated any provision of this
title, or any rule or regulation issued under this title;
or

(i1) is or was a cause of the violation of any provision
of this title, or any rule or regulation thereunder; and

(B) such penalty is in the public interest.

(2) MAXIMUM AMOUNT OF PENALTY.—

(A) FIRST TIER.—The maximum amount of a penalty for
each act or omission described in paragraph (1) shall be
[$7,500] $10,000 for a natural person or [$75,000]
$100,000 for any other person.

(B) SEcOND TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraph (A),
the maximum amount of penalty for each such act or omis-
sion shall be [$75,000]1 $100,000 for a natural person or
[$375,0001 $500,000 for any other person, if the act or
omission described in paragraph (1) involved fraud, deceit,
manipulation, or deliberate or reckless disregard of a regu-
latory requirement.



23

[(C) THIRD TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A)
and (B), the maximum amount of penalty for each such act
or omission shall be $150,000 for a natural person or
$725,000 for any other person, if—

[(@) the act or omission described in paragraph (1)
involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate or
reckless disregard of a regulatory requirement; and

[(ii) such act or omission directly or indirectly re-
sulted in—

[(I) substantial losses or created a significant
risk of substantial losses to other persons; or

[(IT) substantial pecuniary gain to the person
who committed the act or omission.]

(C) THIRD TIER.—

(i) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs
(A) and (B), for a third tier act or omission, the
amount of penalty for each such act or omission shall
not exceed the greater of—

() $1,000,000 for a natural person or
$10,000,000 for any other person;

(II) 3 times the gross amount of pecuniary gain
to the person who committed the act or omission;
or

(III) the amount of losses incurred by victims as
a result of the act or omission.

(it) THIRD TIER ACT OR OMISSION.—For the purposes
of this subparagraph, the term “third tier act or omis-
sion” means an act or omission described in paragraph
(1) that—

(D) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or de-
liberate or reckless disregard of a regulatory re-
quirement; and

(I1) directly or indirectly—

(aa) resulted in substantial losses to other
persons;

(bb) created a significant risk of substantial
losses to other persons; or

(ce) resulted in substantial pecuniary gain to
the person who committed the act or omission.

(D) FOURTH TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A),
(B), and (C), the maximum amount of penalty for each such
act or omission shall be 3 times the otherwise applicable
amount in such subparagraphs if, within the 5-year period
preceding such act or omission, the person who committed
the act or omission was criminally convicted for securities
fraud or became subject to a judgment or order imposing
monetary, equitable, or administrative relief in any Com-
mission action alleging fraud by that person.

(3) EVIDENCE CONCERNING ABILITY TO PAY.—In any pro-
ceeding in which the Commission may impose a penalty under
this section, a respondent may present evidence of the ability
of the respondent to pay such penalty. The Commission may,
in its discretion, consider such evidence in determining wheth-
er such penalty is in the public interest. Such evidence may re-
late to the extent of the ability of the respondent to continue



24

in business and the collectability of a penalty, taking into ac-
count any other claims of the United States or third parties
upon the assets of the respondent and the amount of the assets
of the respondent.

* * * & * * *

INJUNCTIONS AND PROSECUTION OF OFFENSES

SEC. 20. (a) Whenever it shall appear to the Commission, either
upon complaint or otherwise, that the provisions of this title, or of
any rule or regulation prescribed under authority thereof, have
been or are about to be violated, it may, in its discretion, either re-
quire or permit such person to file with it a statement in writing,
under oath, or otherwise, as to all the facts and circumstances con-
cerning the subject matter which it believes to be in the public in-
terest to investigate, and may investigate such facts.

(b) Whenever it shall appear to the Commission that any person
is engaged or about to engage in any acts or practices which con-
stitute or will constitute a violation of the provisions of this title,
or of any rule or regulation prescribed under authority thereof, the
Commission may, in its discretion, bring an action in any district
court of the United States, or United States court of any Territory,
to enjoin such acts or practices, and upon a proper showing, a per-
manent or temporary injunction or restraining order shall be grant-
ed without bond. The Commission may transmit such evidence as
may be available concerning such acts or practices to the Attorney
General who may, in his discretion, institute the necessary crimi-
nal proceedings under this title. Any such criminal proceeding may
be brought either in the district wherein the transmittal of the pro-
spectus or security complained of begins, or in the district wherein
such prospectus or security is received.

(c) Upon application of the Commission, the district courts of the
United States and the United States courts of any Territory shall
have jurisdiction to issue writs of mandamus commanding any per-
son to comply with the provisions of this title or any order of the
Commission made in pursuance thereof.

(d) MONEY PENALTIES IN CIVIL ACTIONS.—

(1) AUTHORITY OF COMMISSION.—Whenever it shall appear to
the Commission that any person has violated any provision of
this title, the rules or regulations thereunder, a Federal court
injunction or a bar obtained or entered by the Commission
under this title, or a cease-and-desist order entered by the
Commission pursuant to section 8A of this title, other than by
committing a violation subject to a penalty pursuant to section
21A of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, the Commission
may bring an action in a United States district court to seek,
and the court shall have jurisdiction to impose, upon a proper
showing, a civil penalty to be paid by the person who com-
mitted such violation.

(2) AMOUNT OF PENALTY.—

(A) FIRST TIER.—The amount of the penalty shall be de-
termined by the court in light of the facts and -cir-
cumstances. For each violation, the amount of the penalty
shall not exceed the greater of (i) [$5,000] $10,000 for a
natural person or [$50,0001 $100,000 for any other per-



25

son, or (ii) the gross amount of pecuniary gain to such de-
fendant as a result of the violation.

(B) SEcOND TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraph (A),
the amount of penalty for each such violation shall not ex-
ceed the greater of (i) [$50,000]1 $100,000 for a natural
person or [$250,0001 $500,000 for any other person, or (ii)
the gross amount of pecuniary gain to such defendant as
a result of the violation, if the violation described in para-
graph (1) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or delib-
erate or reckless disregard of a regulatory requirement.

[(C) THIRD TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A)
and (B), the amount of penalty for each such violation
shall not exceed the greater of (i) $100,000 for a natural
person or $500,000 for any other person, or (ii) the gross
amount of pecuniary gain to such defendant as a result of
the violation, if—

[(I) the violation described in paragraph (1) involved
fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate or reckless
disregard of a regulatory requirement; and

[(II) such violation directly or indirectly resulted in
substantial losses or created a significant risk of sub-
stantial losses to other persons.]

(C) THIRD TIER.—

(i) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs
(A) and (B), for a third tier violation, the amount of
penalty for each violation shall not exceed the greater
of—

() $1,000,000 for a natural person or
$10,000,000 for any other person;

(II) 3 times the gross amount of pecuniary gain
to the person who committed the violation; or

(IID) the amount of losses incurred by victims as
a result of the violation.

(ii) THIRD TIER VIOLATION.—For the purposes of this
subparagraph, the term “third tier violation” means a
violation described in paragraph (1) that—

(D) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or de-
liberate or reckless disregard of a regulatory re-
quirement; and

(I1) directly or indirectly—

(aa) resulted in substantial losses to other
persons;

(bb) created a significant risk of substantial
losses to other persons; or

(cc) resulted in substantial pecuniary gain to
the person who committed the violation.

(D) FOURTH TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A),
(B), and (C), the maximum amount of penalty for each such
violation shall be 3 times the otherwise applicable amount
in such subparagraphs if, within the 5-year period pre-
ceding such violation, the defendant was criminally con-
victed for securities fraud or became subject to a judgment
or order imposing monetary, equitable, or administrative
relief in any Commission action alleging fraud by that de-
fendant.



26

(3) PROCEDURES FOR COLLECTION.—

(A) PAYMENT OF PENALTY TO TREASURY.—A penalty im-
posed under this section shall be payable into the Treasury
of the United States, except as otherwise provided in sec-
tion 308 of the Sarbanes-Oxley Act of 2002 and section 21F
of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934.

(B) COLLECTION OF PENALTIES.—If a person upon whom
such a penalty is imposed shall fail to pay such penalty
within the time prescribed in the court’s order, the Com-
mission may refer the matter to the Attorney General who
shall recover such penalty by action in the appropriate
United States district court.

(C) REMEDY NOT EXCLUSIVE.—The actions authorized by
this subsection may be brought in addition to any other ac-
tion that the Commission or the Attorney General is enti-
tled to bring.

(D) JURISDICTION AND VENUE.—For purposes of section
22 of this title, actions under this section shall be actions
to enforce a liability or a duty created by this title.

[(4) SPECIAL PROVISIONS RELATING TO A VIOLATION OF A
CEASE-AND-DESIST ORDER.—In an action to enforce a cease-and-
desist order entered by the Commission pursuant to section
8A, each separate violation of such order shall be a separate
offense, except that in the case of a violation through a con-
tinuing failure to comply with such an order, each day of the
failure to comply with the order shall be deemed a separate of-
fense.]

(4) SPECIAL PROVISIONS RELATING TO A VIOLATION OF AN IN-
JUNCTION OR CERTAIN ORDERS.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—Each separate violation of an injunc-
tion or order described in subparagraph (B) shall be a sep-
arate offense, except that in the case of a violation through
a continuing failure to comply with such injunction or
order, each day of the failure to comply with the injunction
or order shall be deemed a separate offense.

(B) INJUNCTIONS AND ORDERS.—Subparagraph (A) shall
apply with respect to any action to enforce—

(i) a Federal court injunction obtained pursuant to
this title;

(ii) an order entered or obtained by the Commission
pursuant to this title that bars, suspends, places limi-
tations on the activities or functions of, or prohibits the
activities of a person; or

(iii) a cease-and-desist order entered by the Commis-
sion pursuant to section 8A.

(e) AUTHORITY OF A COURT TO PROHIBIT PERSONS FROM SERVING
AS OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS.—In any proceeding under subsection
(b), the court may prohibit, conditionally or unconditionally, and
permanently or for such period of time as it shall determine, any
person who violated section 17(a)(1) of this title from acting as an
officer or director of any issuer that has a class of securities reg-
istered pursuant to section 12 of the Securities Exchange Act of
1934 or that is required to file reports pursuant to section 15(d) of
such Act if the person’s conduct demonstrates unfitness to serve as
an officer or director of any such issuer.



27

(f) PROHIBITION OF ATTORNEYS' FEES PAID FROM COMMISSION
DiSGORGEMENT FUNDS.—Except as otherwise ordered by the court
upon motion by the Commission, or, in the case of an administra-
tive action, as otherwise ordered by the Commission, funds dis-
gorged as the result of an action brought by the Commission in
Federal court, or as a result of any Commission administrative ac-
tion, shall not be distributed as payment for attorneys’ fees or ex-
penses incurred by private parties seeking distribution of the dis-
gorged funds.

(g) AUTHORITY OF A COURT To PROHIBIT PERSONS FROM PARTICI-
PATING IN AN OFFERING OF PENNY STOCK.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—In any proceeding under subsection (a)
against any person participating in, or, at the time of the al-
leged misconduct, who was participating in, an offering of
penny stock, the court may prohibit that person from partici-
pating in an offering of penny stock, conditionally or uncondi-
tionally, and permanently or for such period of time as the
court shall determine.

(2) DEFINITION.—For purposes of this subsection, the term
“person participating in an offering of penny stock” includes
any person engaging in activities with a broker, dealer, or
issuer for purposes of issuing, trading, or inducing or attempt-
ing to induce the purchase or sale of, any penny stock. The
Commission may, by rule or regulation, define such term to in-
clude other activities, and may, by rule, regulation, or order,
exempt any person or class of persons, in whole or in part, con-
ditionally or unconditionally, from inclusion in such term.

* * * * * * *

SECURITIES EXCHANGE ACT OF 1934
TITLE I—REGULATION OF SECURITIES EXCHANGES

* * k & * * k

INVESTIGATIONS; INJUNCTIONS AND PROSECUTION OF OFFENSES

SEC. 21. (a)(1) The Commission may, in its discretion, make such
investigations as it deems necessary to determine whether any per-
son has violated, is violating, or is about to violate any provision
of this title, the rules or regulations thereunder, the rules of a na-
tional securities exchange or registered securities association of
which such person is a member or a person associated, or, as to
any act or practice, or omission to act, while associated with a
member, formerly associated with a member, the rules of a reg-
istered clearing agency in which such person is a participant, or,
as to any act or practice, or omission to act, while a participant,
was a participant, the rules of the Public Company Accounting
Oversight Board, of which such person is a registered public ac-
counting firm, a person associated with such a firm, or, as to any
act, practice, or omission to act, while associated with such firm,
a person formerly associated with such a firm, or the rules of the
Municipal Securities Rulemaking Board, and may require or per-
mit any person to file with it a statement in writing, under oath
or otherwise as the Commission shall determine, as to all the facts



28

and circumstances concerning the matter to be investigated. The
Commission is authorized in its discretion, to publish information
concerning any such violations, and to investigate any facts, condi-
tions, practices, or matters which it may deem necessary or proper
to aid in the enforcement of such provisions, in the prescribing of
rules and regulations under this title, or in securing information to
serve as a basis for recommending further legislation concerning
the matters to which this title relates.

(2) On request from a foreign securities authority, the Commis-
sion may provide assistance in accordance with this paragraph if
the requesting authority states that the requesting authority is
conducting an investigation which it deems necessary to determine
whether any person has violated, is violating, or is about to violate
any laws or rules relating to securities matters that the requesting
authority administers or enforces. The Commission may, in its dis-
cretion, conduct such investigation as the Commission deems nec-
essary to collect information and evidence pertinent to the request
for assistance. Such assistance may be provided without regard to
whether the facts stated in the request would also constitute a vio-
lation of the laws of the United States. In deciding whether to pro-
vide such assistance, the Commission shall consider whether (A)
the requesting authority has agreed to provide reciprocal assistance
in securities matters to the Commission; and (B) compliance with
the request would prejudice the public interest of the United
States.

(b) For the purpose of any such investigation, or any other pro-
ceeding under this title, any member of the Commission or any offi-
cer designated by it is empowered to administer oaths and affirma-
tions, subpoena witnesses, compel their attendance, take evidence,
and require the production of any books, papers, correspondence,
memoranda, or other records which the Commission deems rel-
evant or material to the inquiry. Such attendance of witnesses and
the production of any such records may be required from any place
in the United States or any State at any designated place of hear-
ing.
(c) In case of contumacy by, or refusal to obey a subpoena issued
to, any person, the Commission may invoke the aid of any court of
the United States within the jurisdiction of which such investiga-
tion or proceeding is carried on, or where such person resides or
carries on business, in requiring the attendance and testimony of
witnesses and the production of books, papers, correspondence,
memoranda, and other records. And such court may issue an order
requiring such person to appear before the Commission or member
or officer designated by the Commission, there to produce records,
if so ordered, or to give testimony touching the matter under inves-
tigation or in question; and any failure to obey such order of the
court may be punished by such court as a contempt thereof. All
process in any such case may be served in the judicial district
whereof such person is an inhabitant or wherever he may be found.
Any person who shall, without just cause, fail or refuse to attend
and testify or to answer any lawful inquiry or to produce books, pa-
pers, correspondence, memoranda, and other records, if in his
power so to do, in obedience to the subpoena of the Commission,
shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and, upon conviction, shall be



29

subject to a fine of not more than $1,000 or to imprisonment for
a term of not more than one year, or both.

(d)(1) Whenever it shall appear to the Commission that any per-
son is engaged or is about to engage in acts or practices consti-
tuting a violation of any provision of this title, the rules or regula-
tions thereunder, the rules of a national securities exchange or reg-
istered securities association of which such person is a member or
a person associated with a member, the rules of a registered clear-
ing agency in which such person is a participant, the rules of the
Public Company Accounting Oversight Board, of which such person
is a registered public accounting firm or a person associated with
such a firm, or the rules of the Municipal Securities Rulemaking
Board, it may in its discretion bring an action in the proper district
court of the United States, the United States District Court for the
District of Columbia, or the United States courts of any territory
or other place subject to the jurisdiction of the United States, to en-
join such acts or practices, and upon a proper showing a permanent
or temporary injunction or restraining order shall be granted with-
out bond. The Commission may transmit such evidence as may be
available concerning such acts or practices as may constitute a vio-
lation of any provision of this title or the rules or regulations there-
under to the Attorney General, who may, in his discretion, institute
the necessary criminal proceedings under this title.

(2) AUTHORITY OF A COURT T0O PROHIBIT PERSONS FROM SERVING
AS OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS.—In any proceeding under paragraph
(1) of this subsection, the court may prohibit, conditionally or un-
conditionally, and permanently or for such period of time as it shall
determine, any person who violated section 10(b) of this title or the
rules or regulations thereunder from acting as an officer or director
of any issuer that has a class of securities registered pursuant to
section 12 of this title or that is required to file reports pursuant
to section 15(d) of this title if the person’s conduct demonstrates
unfitness to serve as an officer or director of any such issuer.

(3) MONEY PENALTIES IN CIVIL ACTIONS.—

(A) AUTHORITY OF COMMISSION.—Whenever it shall appear to
the Commission that any person has violated any provision of
this title, the rules or regulations thereunder, a Federal court
injunction or a bar obtained or entered by the Commission
under this title, or a cease-and-desist order entered by the
Commission pursuant to section 21C of this title, other than by
committing a violation subject to a penalty pursuant to section
21A, the Commission may bring an action in a United States
district court to seek, and the court shall have jurisdiction to
impose, upon a proper showing, a civil penalty to be paid by
the person who committed such violation.

(B) AMOUNT OF PENALTY.—

(i) FIRST TIER.—The amount of the penalty shall be de-
termined by the court in light of the facts and cir-
cumstances. For each violation, the amount of the penalty
shall not exceed the greater of (I) [$5,000] $10,000 for a
natural person or [$50,0001 $100,000 for any other per-
son, or (II) the gross amount of pecuniary gain to such de-
fendant as a result of the violation.

(i) SECOND TIER.—Notwithstanding clause (i), the
amount of penalty for each such violation shall not exceed



30

the greater of (I) [$50,0001 $100,000 for a natural person
or [$250,0001 $500,000 for any other person, or (II) the
gross amount of pecuniary gain to such defendant as a re-
sult of the violation, if the violation described in subpara-
graph (A) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or delib-
erate or reckless disregard of a regulatory requirement.

[(Gii)) THIRD TIER.—Notwithstanding clauses (i) and (ii),
the amount of penalty for each such violation shall not ex-
ceed the greater of (I) $100,000 for a natural person or
$500,000 for any other person, or (II) the gross amount of
pecuniary gain to such defendant as a result of the viola-
tion, if—

[(aa) the violation described in subparagraph (A) in-
volved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate or
reckless disregard of a regulatory requirement; and

[(bb) such violation directly or indirectly resulted in
substantial losses or created a significant risk of sub-
stantial losses to other persons.]

(iii) THIRD TIER.—

(I) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding clauses (i) and
(it), for a third tier violation, the amount of penalty for
each such violation shall not exceed the greater of—

(aa) $1,000,000 for a natural person or
$10,000,000 for any other person;

(bb) 3 times the gross amount of pecuniary gain
to the person who committed the violation; or

(cc) the amount of losses incurred by victims as
a result of the violation.

(II) THIRD TIER VIOLATION.—For the purposes of this
clause, the term “third tier violation” means a violation
described in subparagraph (A) that—

(aa) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or de-
liberate or reckless disregard of a regulatory re-
quirement; and

(bb) directly or indirectly—

(AA) resulted in substantial losses to other
persons;

(BB) created a significant risk of substantial
losses to other persons; or

(CC) resulted in substantial pecuniary gain
to the person who committed the violation.

(iv) FOURTH TIER.—Notwithstanding clauses (i), (ii), and
(iii), the maximum amount of penalty for each such viola-
tion shall be 3 times the otherwise applicable amount in
such clauses if, within the 5-year period preceding such vio-
lation, the defendant was criminally convicted for securities
fraud or became subject to a judgment or order imposing
monetary, equitable, or administrative relief in any Com-
mission action alleging fraud by that defendant.

(C) PROCEDURES FOR COLLECTION.—

(i) PAYMENT OF PENALTY TO TREASURY.—A penalty im-
posed under this section shall be payable into the Treasury
of the United States, except as otherwise provided in sec-
tion 308 of the Sarbanes-Oxley Act of 2002 and section 21F
of this title.



31

(i1)) COLLECTION OF PENALTIES.—If a person upon whom
such a penalty is imposed shall fail to pay such penalty
within the time prescribed in the court’s order, the Com-
mission may refer the matter to the Attorney General who
shall recover such penalty by action in the appropriate
United States district court.

(ii1) REMEDY NOT EXCLUSIVE.—The actions authorized by
this paragraph may be brought in addition to any other ac-
tion that the Commission or the Attorney General is enti-
tled to bring.

(iv) JURISDICTION AND VENUE.—For purposes of section
27 of this title, actions under this paragraph shall be ac-
tions to enforce a liability or a duty created by this title.

[(D) SPECIAL PROVISIONS RELATING TO A VIOLATION OF A
CEASE-AND-DESIST ORDER.—In an action to enforce a cease-and-
desist order entered by the Commission pursuant to section
21C, each separate violation of such order shall be a separate
offense, except that in the case of a violation through a con-
tinuing failure to comply with the order, each day of the failure
to comply shall be deemed a separate offense.]

(D) SPECIAL PROVISIONS RELATING TO A VIOLATION OF AN IN-
JUNCTION OR CERTAIN ORDERS.—

(i) IN GENERAL.—Each separate violation of an injunction
or order described in clause (i) shall be a separate offense,
except that in the case of a violation through a continuing
failure to comply with such injunction or order, each day
of the failure to comply with the injunction or order shall
be deemed a separate offense.

(it) INJUNCTIONS AND ORDERS.—Clause (i) shall apply
with respect to an action to enforce—

(I) a Federal court injunction obtained pursuant to
this title;

(II) an order entered or obtained by the Commission
pursuant to this title that bars, suspends, places limi-
tations on the activities or functions of, or prohibits the
activities of a person; or

(I11) a cease-and-desist order entered by the Commis-
sion pursuant to section 21C.

(4) PROHIBITION OF ATTORNEYS' FEES PAID FROM COMMISSION
DISGORGEMENT FUNDS.—Except as otherwise ordered by the
court upon motion by the Commission, or, in the case of an ad-
ministrative action, as otherwise ordered by the Commission,
funds disgorged as the result of an action brought by the Com-
mission in Federal court, or as a result of any Commission ad-
ministrative action, shall not be distributed as payment for at-
torneys’ fees or expenses incurred by private parties seeking
distribution of the disgorged funds.

(5) EQUITABLE RELIEF.—In any action or proceeding brought or
instituted by the Commission under any provision of the securities
laws, the Commission may seek, and any Federal court may grant,
any equitable relief that may be appropriate or necessary for the
benefit of investors.

(6) AUTHORITY OF A COURT TO PROHIBIT PERSONS FROM PARTICI-
PATING IN AN OFFERING OF PENNY STOCK.—



32

(A) IN GENERAL.—In any proceeding under paragraph (1)
against any person participating in, or, at the time of the al-
leged misconduct who was participating in, an offering of
penny stock, the court may prohibit that person from partici-
pating in an offering of penny stock, conditionally or uncondi-
tionally, and permanently or for such period of time as the
court shall determine.

(B) DEFINITION.—For purposes of this paragraph, the term
“person participating in an offering of penny stock” includes
any person engaging in activities with a broker, dealer, or
issuer for purposes of issuing, trading, or inducing or attempt-
ing to induce the purchase or sale of, any penny stock. The
Commission may, by rule or regulation, define such term to in-
clude other activities, and may, by rule, regulation, or order,
exempt any person or class of persons, in whole or in part, con-
ditionally or unconditionally, from inclusion in such term.

(e) Upon application of the Commission the district courts of the
United States and the United States courts of any territory or
other place subject to the jurisdiction of the United States shall
have jurisdiction to issue writs of mandamus, injunctions, and or-
ders commanding (1) any person to comply with the provisions of
this title, the rules, regulations, and orders thereunder, the rules
of a national securities exchange or registered securities association
of which such person is a member or person associated with a
member, the rules of a registered clearing agency in which such
person is a participant, the rules of the Public Company Account-
ing Oversight Board, of which such person is a registered public ac-
counting firm or a person associated with such a firm, the rules of
the Municipal Securities Rulemaking Board, or any undertaking
contained in a registration statement as provided in subsection (d)
of section 15 of this title, (2) any national securities exchange or
registered securities association to enforce compliance by its mem-
bers and persons associated with its members with the provisions
of this title, the rules, regulations, and orders thereunder, and the
rules of such exchange or association, or (3) any registered clearing
agency to enforce compliance by its participants with the provisions
of the rules of such clearing agency.

(f) Notwithstanding any other provision of this title, the Commis-
sion shall not bring any action pursuant to subsection (d) or (e) of
this section against any person for violation of, or to command com-
pliance with, the rules of a self-regulatory organization or the Pub-
lic Company Accounting Oversight Board unless it appears to the
Commission that (1) such self-regulatory organization or the Public
Company Accounting Oversight Board is unable or unwilling to
take appropriate action against such person in the public interest
and for the protection of investors, or (2) such action is otherwise
necessary or appropriate in the public interest or for the protection
of investors.

(g) Notwithstanding the provisions of section 1407(a) of title 28,
United States Code, or any other provision of law, no action for eq-
uitable relief instituted by the Commission pursuant to the securi-
ties laws shall be consolidated or coordinated with other actions not
brought by the Commission, even though such other actions may
involve common questions of fact, unless such consolidation is con-
sented to by the Commission.



33

(h)(1) The Right to Financial Privacy Act of 1978 shall apply with
respect to the Commission, except as otherwise provided in this
subsection.

(2) Notwithstanding section 1105 or 1107 of the Right to Finan-
cial Privacy Act of 1978, the Commission may have access to and
obtain copies of, or the information contained in financial records
of a customer from a financial institution without prior notice to
the customer upon an ex parte showing to an appropriate United
States district court that the Commission seeks such financial
records pursuant to a subpoena issued in conformity with the re-
quirements of section 19(b) of the Securities Act of 1933, section
21(b) of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, section 42(b) of the
Investment Company Act of 1940, or section 209(b) of the Invest-
ment Advisers Act of 1940, and that the Commission has reason to
believe that—

(A) delay in obtaining access to such financial records, or the
required notice, will result in—

(1) flight from prosecution;

(i1) destruction of or tampering with evidence;

(ii1) transfer of assets or records outside the territorial
limits of the United States;

(iv) improper conversion of investor assets; or

(v) impeding the ability of the Commission to identify or
trace the source or disposition of funds involved in any se-
curities transaction;

(B) such financial records are necessary to identify or trace
the record or beneficial ownership interest in any security;

(C) the acts, practices or course of conduct under investiga-
tion involve—

(1) the dissemination of materially false or misleading in-
formation concerning any security, issuer, or market, or
the failure to make disclosures required under the securi-
ties laws, which remain uncorrected; or

(i) a financial loss to investors or other persons pro-
tected under the securities laws which remains substan-
tially uncompensated; or

(D) the acts, practices or course of conduct under investiga-
tion—

(1) involve significant financial speculation in securities;
or

(i1) endanger the stability of any financial or investment
intermediary.

(3) Any application under paragraph (2) for a delay in notice
shall be made with reasonable specificity.

(4)(A) Upon a showing described in paragraph (2), the presiding
judge or magistrate shall enter an ex parte order granting the re-
quested delay for a period not to exceed ninety days and an order
prohibiting the financial institution involved from disclosing that
rec?irds have been obtained or that a request for records has been
made.

(B) Extensions of the period of delay of notice provided in sub-
paragraph (A) of up to ninety days each may be granted by the
court upon application, but only in accordance with this subsection
or section 1109(a), (b)(1), or (b)(2) of the Right to Financial Privacy
Act of 1978.



34

(C) Upon expiration of the period of delay of notification ordered
under subparagraph (A) or (B), the customer shall be served with
or mailed a copy of the subpena insofar as it applies to the cus-
tomer together with the following notice which shall describe with
reasonable specificity the nature of the investigation for which the
Commission sought the financial records:“Records or information
concerning your transactions which are held by the financial insti-
tution named in the attached subpena were supplied to the Securi-
ties and Exchange Commission on (date). Notification was withheld
pursuant to a determination by the (title of court so ordering)
under section 21(h) of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934 that
(state reason). The purpose of the investigation or official pro-
ceeding was (state purpose).”

(5) Upon application by the Commission, all proceedings pursu-
ant to paragraphs (2) and (4) shall be held in camera and the
records thereof sealed until expiration of the period of delay or such
other date as the presiding judge or magistrate may permit.

(7T)(A) Following the expiration of the period of delay of notifica-
tion ordered by the court pursuant to paragraph (4) of this sub-
section, the customer may, upon motion, reopen the proceeding in
the district court which issued the order. If the presiding judge or
magistrate finds that the movant is the customer to whom the
records obtained by the Commission pertain, and that the Commis-
sion has obtained financial records or information contained there-
in in violation of this subsection, other than paragraph (1), it may
order that the customer be granted civil penalties against the Com-
mission in an amount equal to the sum of—

(1) $100 without regard to the volume of records involved;

(i) any out-of-pocket damages sustained by the customer as
a direct result of the disclosure; and

(iii) if the violation is found to have been willful, intentional,
and without good faith, such punitive damages as the court
may allow, together with the costs of the action and reasonable
attorney’s fees as determined by the court.

(B) Upon a finding that the Commission has obtained financial
records or information contained therein in violation of this sub-
section, other than paragraph (1), the court, in its discretion, may
also or in the alternative issue injunctive relief to require the Com-
mission to comply with this subsection with respect to any subpena
which the Commission issues in the future for financial records of
such customer for purposes of the same investigation.

(C) Whenever the court determines that the Commission has
failed to comply with this subsection, other than paragraph (1), and
the court finds that the circumstances raise questions of whether
an officer or employee of the Commission acted in a willful and in-
tentional manner and without good faith with respect to the viola-
tion, the Office of Personnel Management shall promptly initiate a
proceeding to determine whether disciplinary action is warranted
against the agent or employee who was primarily responsible for
the violation. After investigating and considering the evidence sub-
mitted, the Office of Personnel Management shall submit its find-
ings and recommendations to the Commission and shall send cop-
ies of the findings and recommendations to the officer or employee
or his representative. The Commission shall take the corrective ac-
tion that the Office of Personnel Management recommends.



35

(8) The relief described in paragraphs (7) and (10) shall be the
only remedies or sanctions available to a customer for a violation
of this subsection, other than paragraph (1), and nothing herein or
in the Right to Financial Privacy Act of 1978 shall be deemed to
prohibit the use in any investigation or proceeding of financial
records, or the information contained therein, obtained by a sub-
pena issued by the Commission. In the case of an unsuccessful ac-
tion under paragraph (7), the court shall award the costs of the ac-
tion and attorney’s fees to the Commission if the presiding judge
?r I}Jrllagistrate finds that the customer’s claims were made in bad
aith.

(9)(A) The Commission may transfer financial records or the in-
formation contained therein to any government authority if the
Commission proceeds as a transferring agency in accordance with
section 1112 of the Right to Financial Privacy Act of 1978, except
that the customer notice required under section 1112(b) or (c) of
such Act may be delayed upon a showing by the Commission, in
accordance with the procedure set forth in paragraphs (4) and (5),
that'i one or more of subparagraphs (A) through (D) of paragraph (2)
apply.

(B) The Commission may, without notice to the customer pursu-
ant to section 1112 of the Right to Financial Privacy Act of 1978,
transfer financial records or the information contained therein to a
State securities agency or to the Department of Justice. Financial
records or information transferred by the Commission to the De-
partment of Justice or to a State securities agency pursuant to the
provisions of this subparagraph may be disclosed or used only in
an administrative, civil, or criminal action or investigation by the
Department of Justice or the State securities agency which arises
out of or relates to the acts, practices, or courses of conduct inves-
tigated by the Commission, except that if the Department of Jus-
tice or the State securities agency determines that the information
should be disclosed or used for any other purpose, it may do so if
it notifies the customer, except as otherwise provided in the Right
to Financial Privacy Act of 1978, within 30 days of its determina-
tion, or complies with the requirements of section 1109 of such Act
regarding delay of notice.

(10) Any government authority violating paragraph (9) shall be
subject to the procedures and penalties applicable to the Commis-
sion under paragraph (7)(A) with respect to a violation by the Com-
mission in obtaining financial records.

(11) Notwithstanding the provisions of this subsection, the Com-
mission may obtain financial records from a financial institution or
transfer such records in accordance with provisions of the Right to
Financial Privacy Act of 1978.

(12) Nothing in this subsection shall enlarge or restrict any
rights of a financial institution to challenge requests for records
made by the Commission under existing law. Nothing in this sub-
section shall entitle a customer to assert any rights of a financial
institution.

(13) Unless the context otherwise requires, all terms defined in
the Right to Financial Privacy Act of 1978 which are common to
this subsection shall have the same meaning as in such Act.

(i) INFORMATION TO CFTC.—The Commission shall provide the
Commodity Futures Trading Commission with notice of the com-



36

mencement of any proceeding and a copy of any order entered by
the Commission against any broker or dealer registered pursuant
to section 15(b)(11), any exchange registered pursuant to section
6(g), or any national securities association registered pursuant to
section 15A(k).

* * * & * * *

CIVIL REMEDIES IN ADMINISTRATIVE PROCEEDINGS

SEC. 21B. (a) COMMISSION AUTHORITY TO ASSESs MONEY PEN-
ALTIES.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—In any proceeding instituted pursuant to
sections 15(b)(4), 15(b)(6), 15D, 15B, 15C, 15E, or 17A of this
title against any person, the Commission or the appropriate
regulatory agency may impose a civil penalty if it finds, on the
record after notice and opportunity for hearing, that such pen-
alty is in the public interest and that such person—

(A) has willfully violated any provision of the Securities
Act of 1933, the Investment Company Act of 1940, the In-
vestment Advisers Act of 1940, or this title, or the rules
or regulations thereunder, or the rules of the Municipal
Securities Rulemaking Board;

(B) has willfully aided, abetted, counseled, commanded,
induced, or procured such a violation by any other person;

(C) has willfully made or caused to be made in any ap-
plication for registration or report required to be filed with
the Commission or with any other appropriate regulatory
agency under this title, or in any proceeding before the
Commission with respect to registration, any statement
which was, at the time and in the light of the cir-
cumstances under which it was made, false or misleading
with respect to any material fact, or has omitted to state
in any such application or report any material fact which
is required to be stated therein; or

(D) has failed reasonably to supervise, within the mean-
ing of section 15(b)(4)(E) of this title, with a view to pre-
venting violations of the provisions of such statutes, rules
and regulations, another person who commits such a viola-
tion, if such other person is subject to his supervision;

(2) CEASE-AND-DESIST PROCEEDINGS.—In any proceeding in-
stituted under section 21C against any person, the Commission
may impose a civil penalty, if the Commission finds, on the
record after notice and opportunity for hearing, that such per-
son—

(A) is violating or has violated any provision of this title,
or any rule or regulation issued under this title; or

(B) is or was a cause of the violation of any provision of
this title, or any rule or regulation issued under this title.

(b) MAXIMUM AMOUNT OF PENALTY.—

(1) FIRST TIER.—The maximum amount of penalty for each
act or omission described in subsection (a) shall be [$5,000]
$10,000 for a natural person or [$50,0001 $100,000 for any
other person.

(2) SECOND TIER.—Notwithstanding paragraph (1), the max-
imum amount of penalty for each such act or omission shall be



37

[$50,0001 $100,000 for a natural person or [$250,000]
$500,000 for any other person if the act or omission described
in subsection (a) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or delib-
erate or reckless disregard of a regulatory requirement.

[(3) THIRD TIER.—Notwithstanding paragraphs (1) and (2),
the maximum amount of penalty for each such act or omission
shall be $100,000 for a natural person or $500,000 for any
other person if—

[(A) the act or omission described in subsection (a) in-
volved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate or reck-
less disregard of a regulatory requirement; and

[(B) such act or omission directly or indirectly resulted
in substantial losses or created a significant risk of sub-
stantial losses to other persons or resulted in substantial
pecuniary gain to the person who committed the act or
omission. |

(3) THIRD TIER.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding paragraphs (1) and
(2), for a third tier act or omission, the amount of penalty
for each such act or omission shall not exceed the greater
of—

(1) $1,000,000 for a natural person or $10,000,000 for
any other person;

(it) 3 times the gross amount of pecuniary gain to the
person who committed the act or omission; or

(iii) the amount of losses incurred by victims as a re-
sult of the act or omission.

(B) THIRD TIER ACT OR OMISSION.—For the purposes of
this paragraph, the term “third tier act or omission” means
an act or omission described in paragraph (1) that—

(i) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate
or reckless disregard of a regulatory requirement; and
(it) directly or indirectly—
(D) resulted in substantial losses to other persons;
(Il) created a significant risk of substantial
losses to other persons; or
(I1I) resulted in substantial pecuniary gain to
the person who committed the act or omission.

(4) FOURTH TIER.—Notwithstanding paragraphs (1), (2), and
(3), the maximum amount of penalty for each such act or omis-
sion shall be 3 times the otherwise applicable amount in such
paragraphs if, within the 5-year period preceding such act or
omission, the person who committed the act or omission was
criminally convicted for securities fraud or became subject to a
Jjudgment or order imposing monetary, equitable, or administra-
tive relief in any Commission action alleging fraud by that per-
son.

(c) DETERMINATION OF PUBLIC INTEREST.—In considering under
this section whether a penalty is in the public interest, the Com-
mission or the appropriate regulatory agency may consider—

(1) whether the act or omission for which such penalty is as-
sessed involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate or
reckless disregard of a regulatory requirement;

(2) the harm to other persons resulting either directly or in-
directly from such act or omission;



38

(3) the extent to which any person was unjustly enriched,
taking into account any restitution made to persons injured by
such behavior;

(4) whether such person previously has been found by the
Commission, another appropriate regulatory agency, or a self-
regulatory organization to have violated the Federal securities
laws, State securities laws, or the rules of a self-regulatory or-
ganization, has been enjoined by a court of competent jurisdic-
tion from violations of such laws or rules, or has been convicted
by a court of competent jurisdiction of violations of such laws
or of any felony or misdemeanor described in section
15(b)(4)(B) of this title;

(5) the need to deter such person and other persons from
committing such acts or omissions; and

(6) such other matters as justice may require.

(d) EVIDENCE CONCERNING ABILITY TO PAY.—In any proceeding
in which the Commission or the appropriate regulatory agency may
impose a penalty under this section, a respondent may present evi-
dence of the respondent’s ability to pay such penalty. The Commis-
sion or the appropriate regulatory agency may, in its discretion,
consider such evidence in determining whether such penalty is in
the public interest. Such evidence may relate to the extent of such
person’s ability to continue in business and the collectability of a
penalty, taking into account any other claims of the United States
or third parties upon such person’s assets and the amount of such
person’s assets.

(e) AUTHORITY To ENTER AN ORDER REQUIRING AN ACCOUNTING
AND DISGORGEMENT.—In any proceeding in which the Commission
or the appropriate regulatory agency may impose a penalty under
this section, the Commission or the appropriate regulatory agency
may enter an order requiring accounting and disgorgement, includ-
ing reasonable interest. The Commission is authorized to adopt
rules, regulations, and orders concerning payments to investors,
rates of interest, periods of accrual, and such other matters as it
deems appropriate to implement this subsection.

(f) SECURITY-BASED SWAPS.—

(1) CLEARING AGENCY.—Any clearing agency that knowingly
or recklessly evades or participates in or facilitates an evasion
of the requirements of section 3C shall be liable for a civil
money penalty in twice the amount otherwise available for a
violation of section 3C.

(2) SECURITY-BASED SWAP DEALER OR MAJOR SECURITY-BASED
SWAP PARTICIPANT.—Any security-based swap dealer or major
security-based swap participant that knowingly or recklessly
evades or participates in or facilitates an evasion of the re-
quirements of section 3C shall be liable for a civil money pen-
alty in twice the amount otherwise available for a violation of
section 3C.

* * & & * * *k

INVESTMENT COMPANY ACT OF 1940

* * *k & * * *k



39
TITLE I—-INVESTMENT COMPANIES

* * * & * * *

INELIGIBILITY OF CERTAIN AFFILIATED PERSONS AND UNDERWRITERS

SEC. 9. (a) It shall be unlawful for any of the following persons
to serve or act in the capacity of employee, officer, director, member
of an advisory board, investment adviser, or depositor of any reg-
istered investment company, or principal underwriter for any reg-
istered open-end company, registered unit investment trust, or reg-
istered face-amount certificate company:

(1) any person who within 10 years has been convicted of
any felony or misdemeanor involving the purchase or sale of
any security or arising out of such person’s conduct as an un-
derwriter, broker, dealer, investment adviser, municipal securi-
ties dealer, government securities broker, government securi-
ties dealer, bank, transfer agent, credit rating agency, or entity
or person required to be registered under the Commodity Ex-
change Act, or as an affiliated person, salesman, or employee
of any investment company, bank, insurance company, or enti-
ty or person required to be registered under the Commodity
Exchange Act;

(2) any person who, by reason of any misconduct, is perma-
nently or temporarily enjoined by order, judgment, or decree of
any court of competent jurisdiction from acting as an under-
writer, broker, dealer, investment adviser, municipal securities
dealer, government securities broker, government securities
dealer, bank, transfer agent, credit rating agency, or entity or
person required to be registered under the Commodity Ex-
change Act, or as an affiliated person, salesman, or employee
of any investment company, bank, insurance company, or enti-
ty or person required to be registered under the Commodity
Exchange Act, or from engaging in or continuing any conduct
or practice in connection with any such activity or in connec-
tion with the purchase or sale of any security; or

(3) a company any affiliated person of which is ineligible, by
reason of paragraph (1) or (2), to serve or act in the foregoing
capacities.

For the purposes of paragraphs (1), (2), and (3) of this subsection,
the term “investment adviser” shall include an investment adviser
as defined in title II of this Act.

(b) The Commission may, after notice and opportunity for hear-
ing, by order prohibit, conditionally or unconditionally, either per-
manently or for such period of time as it in its discretion shall
deem appropriate in the public interest, any person from serving
or acting as an employee, officer, director, member of an advisory
board, investment adviser or depositor of, or principal underwriter
for, a registered investment company or affiliated person of such
investment adviser, depositor, or principal underwriter, if such per-
son—

(1) has willfully made or caused to be made in any registra-
tion statement, application or report filed with the Commission
under this title any statement which was at the time and in
the light of the circumstances under which it was made false
or misleading with respect to any material fact, or has omitted



40

to state in any such registration statement, application, or re-
port any material fact which was required to be stated therein;

(2) has willfully violated any provision of the Securities Act
of 1933, or of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, or of title
II of this Act, or of this title, or of the Commodity Exchange
Act, or of any rule or regulation under any of such statutes;

(3) has willfully aided, abetted, counseled, commanded, in-
duced, or procured the violation by any other person of the Se-
curities Act of 1933, or of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934,
or of title II of this Act, or of this title, or of the Commodity
Exchange Act, or of any rule or regulation under any of such
statutes;

(ﬁ) has been found by a foreign financial regulatory authority
to have—

(A) made or caused to be made in any application for
registration or report required to be filed with a foreign se-
curities authority, or in any proceeding before a foreign se-
curities authority with respect to registration, any state-
ment that was at the time and in light of the cir-
cumstances under which it was made false or misleading
with respect to any material fact, or has omitted to state
in any application or report to a foreign securities author-
ity any material fact that is required to be stated therein;

(B) violated any foreign statute or regulation regarding
transactions in securities or contracts of sale of a com-
modity for future delivery traded on or subject to the rules
of a contract market or any board of trade; or

(C) aided, abetted, counseled, commanded, induced, or
procured the violation by any other person of any foreign
statute or regulation regarding transactions in securities
or contracts of sale of a commodity for future delivery trad-
ed on or subject to the rules of a contract market or any
board of trade;

(5) within 10 years has been convicted by a foreign court of
competent jurisdiction of a crime, however denominated by the
laws of the relevant foreign government, that is substantially
eq)uivalent to an offense set forth in paragraph (1) of subsection
(a); or

(6) by reason of any misconduct, is temporarily or perma-
nently enjoined by any foreign court of competent jurisdiction
from acting in any of the capacities, set forth in paragraph (2)
of subsection (a), or a substantially equivalent foreign capacity,
or from engaging in or continuing any conduct or practice in
connection with any such activity or in connection with the
purchase or sale of any security.

(¢) Any person who is ineligible, by reason of subsection (a), to
serve or act in the capacities enumerated in that subsection, may
file with the Commission an application for an exemption from the
provisions of that subsection. The Commission shall by order grant
such application, either unconditionally or on an appropriate tem-
porary or other conditional basis, if it is established that the prohi-
bitions of subsection (a), as applied to such person, are unduly or
disproportionately severe or that the conduct of such person has
been such as not to make it against the public interest or protec-
tion of investors to grant such application.



41

(d) MONEY PENALTIES IN ADMINISTRATIVE PROCEEDINGS.—
(1) AUTHORITY OF COMMISSION.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—In any proceeding instituted pursuant
to subsection (b) against any person, the Commission may
impose a civil penalty if it finds, on the record after notice
and opportunity for hearing, that such penalty is in the
public interest, and that such person—

(i) has willfully violated any provision of the Securi-
ties Act of 1933, the Securities Exchange Act of 1934,
the Investment Advisers Act of 1940, or this title, or
the rules or regulations thereunder;

(i1)) has willfully aided, abetted, counseled, com-
manded, induced, or procured such a violation by any
other person; or

(iii) has willfully made or caused to be made in any
registration statement, application, or report required
to be filed with the Commission under this title, any
statement which was, at the time and in the light of
the circumstances under which it was made, false or
misleading with respect to any material fact, or has
omitted to state in any such registration statement,
application, or report any material fact which was re-
quired to be stated therein;

(B) CEASE-AND-DESIST PROCEEDINGS.—In any proceeding
instituted pursuant to subsection (f) against any person,
the Commission may impose a civil penalty if the Commis-
sion finds, on the record, after notice and opportunity for
hearing, that such person—

(i) is violating or has violated any provision of this
title, or any rule or regulation issued under this title;
or

(ii) is or was a cause of the violation of any provision
of ichis title, or any rule or regulation issued under this
title.

(2) MAXIMUM AMOUNT OF PENALTY.—

(A) FIRST TIER.—The maximum amount of penalty for
each act or omission described in paragraph (1) shall be
[$5,000] $10,000 for a natural person or [$50,000]
$100,000 for any other person.

(B) SECOND TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraph (A),
the maximum amount of penalty for each such act or omis-
sion shall be [$50,000]1 $100,000 for a natural person or
[$250,0001 $500,000 for any other person if the act or
omission described in paragraph (1) involved fraud, deceit,
manipulation, or deliberate or reckless disregard of a regu-
latory requirement.

[(C) THIRD TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A)
and (B), the maximum amount of penalty for each such act
or omission shall be $100,000 for a natural person or
$500,000 for any other person if—

[(i) the act or omission described in paragraph (1)
involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate or
reckless disregard of a regulatory requirement; and

[(i1) such act or omission directly or indirectly re-
sulted in substantial losses or created a significant



42

risk of substantial losses to other persons or resulted
in substantial pecuniary gain to the person who com-
mitted the act or omission. ]

(C) THIRD TIER.—

(i) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs
(A) and (B), for a third tier act or omission, the
amount of penalty for each such act or omission shall
not exceed the greater of—

(D) $1,000,000 for a natural person or
$10,000,000 for any other person;

(II) 3 times the gross amount of pecuniary gain
to the person who committed the act or omission;
or

(IID) the amount of losses incurred by victims as
a result of the act or omission.

(ii) THIRD TIER ACT OR OMISSION.—For the purposes
of this subparagraph, the term “third tier act or omis-
sion” means an act or omission described in paragraph
(D that—

(D) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or de-
liberate or reckless disregard of a regulatory re-
quirement; and

(II) directly or indirectly—

(aa) resulted in substantial losses to other
persons;

(bb) created a significant risk of substantial
losses to other persons; or

(cc) resulted in substantial pecuniary gain to
the person who committed the act or omission.

(D) FOURTH TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A),
(B), and (C), the maximum amount of penalty for each such
act or omission shall be 3 times the otherwise applicable
amount in such subparagraphs if, within the 5-year period
preceding such act or omission, the person who committed
the act or omission was criminally convicted for securities
fraud or became subject to a judgment or order imposing
monetary, equitable, or administrative relief in any Com-
mission action alleging fraud by that person.

(3) DETERMINATION OF PUBLIC INTEREST.—In considering
under this section whether a penalty is in the public interest,
the Commission may consider—

(A) whether the act or omission for which such penalty
is assessed involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or delib-
erate or reckless disregard of a regulatory requirement,;

(B) the harm to other persons resulting either directly or
indirectly from such act or omission;

(C) the extent to which any person was unjustly en-
riched, taking into account any restitution made to persons
injured by such behavior;

(D) whether such person previously has been found by
the Commission, another appropriate regulatory agency, or
a self-regulatory organization to have violated the Federal
securities laws, State securities laws, or the rules of a self-
regulatory organization, has been enjoined by a court of
competent jurisdiction from violations of such laws or



43

rules, or has been convicted by a court of competent juris-
diction of violations of such laws or of any felony or mis-
demeanor described in section 203(e)(2) of the Investment
Advisers Act of 1940;

(E) the need to deter such person and other persons from
committing such acts or omissions; and

(F) such other matters as justice may require.

(4) EVIDENCE CONCERNING ABILITY TO PAY.—In any pro-
ceeding in which the Commission may impose a penalty under
this section, a respondent may present evidence of the respond-
ent’s ability to pay such penalty. The Commission may, in its
discretion, consider such evidence in determining whether such
penalty is in the public interest. Such evidence may relate to
the extent of such person’s ability to continue in business and
the collectability of a penalty, taking into account any other
claims of the United States or third parties upon such person’s
assets and the amount of such person’s assets.

(e) AUTHORITY To ENTER AN ORDER REQUIRING AN ACCOUNTING
AND DISGORGEMENT.—In any proceeding in which the Commission
may impose a penalty under this section, the Commission may
enter an order requiring accounting and disgorgement, including
reasonable interest. The Commission is authorized to adopt rules,
regulations, and orders concerning payments to investors, rates of
interest, periods of accrual, and such other matters as it deems ap-
propriate to implement this subsection.

(f) CEASE-AND-DESIST PROCEEDINGS.—

(1) AUTHORITY OF THE COMMISSION.—If the Commission
finds, after notice and opportunity for hearing, that any person
is violating, has violated, or is about to violate any provision
of this title, or any rule or regulation thereunder, the Commis-
sion may publish its findings and enter an order requiring
such person, and any other person that is, was, or would be a
cause of the violation, due to an act or omission the person
knew or should have known would contribute to such violation,
to cease and desist from committing or causing such violation
and any future violation of the same provision, rule, or regula-
tion. Such order may, in addition to requiring a person to cease
and desist from committing or causing a violation, require such
person to comply, or to take steps to effect compliance, with
such provision, rule, or regulation, upon such terms and condi-
tions and within such time as the Commission may specify in
such order. Any such order may, as the Commission deems ap-
propriate, require future compliance or steps to effect future
compliance, either permanently or for such period of time as
the Commission may specify, with such provision, rule, or reg-
ulation with respect to any security, any issuer, or any other
person.

(2) HEARING.—The notice instituting proceedings pursuant to
paragraph (1) shall fix a hearing date not earlier than 30 days
nor later than 60 days after service of the notice unless an ear-
lier or a later date is set by the Commission with the consent
of any respondent so served.

(3) TEMPORARY ORDER.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—Whenever the Commission determines
that the alleged violation or threatened violation specified



44

in the notice instituting proceedings pursuant to para-
graph (1), or the continuation thereof, is likely to result in
significant dissipation or conversion of assets, significant
harm to investors, or substantial harm to the public inter-
est, including, but not limited to, losses to the Securities
Investor Protection Corporation, prior to the completion of
the proceeding, the Commission may enter a temporary
order requiring the respondent to cease and desist from
the violation or threatened violation and to take such ac-
tion to prevent the violation or threatened violation and to
prevent dissipation or conversion of assets, significant
harm to investors, or substantial harm to the public inter-
est as the Commission deems appropriate pending comple-
tion of such proceedings. Such an order shall be entered
only after notice and opportunity for a hearing, unless the
Commission, notwithstanding section 40(a) of this title, de-
termines that notice and hearing prior to entry would be
impracticable or contrary to the public interest. A tem-
porary order shall become effective upon service upon the
respondent and, unless set aside, limited, or suspended by
the Commission or a court of competent jurisdiction, shall
remain effective and enforceable pending the completion of
the proceedings.

(B) AppLICABILITY.—This paragraph shall apply only to
a respondent that acts, or, at the time of the alleged mis-
conduct acted, as a broker, dealer, investment adviser, in-
vestment company, municipal securities dealer, govern-
ment securities broker, government securities dealer, or
transfer agent, or is, or was at the time of the alleged mis-
conduct, an associated person of, or a person seeking to be-
come associated with, any of the foregoing.

(4) REVIEW OF TEMPORARY ORDERS.—

(A) COMMISSION REVIEW.—At any time after the re-
spondent has been served with a temporary cease-and-de-
sist order pursuant to paragraph (3), the respondent may
apply to the Commission to have the order set aside, lim-
ited, or suspended. If the respondent has been served with
a temporary cease-and-desist order entered without a prior
Commission hearing, the respondent may, within 10 days
after the date on which the order was served, request a
hearing on such application and the Commission shall hold
a hearing and render a decision on such application at the
earliest possible time.

(B) JubpICIAL REVIEW.—Within—

(i) 10 days after the date the respondent was served
with a temporary cease-and-desist order entered with
a prior Commission hearing, or
(i1) 10 days after the Commission renders a decision
on an application and hearing under subparagraph
(A), with respect to any temporary cease-and-desist
order entered without a prior Commission hearing,
the respondent may apply to the United States district
court for the district in which the respondent resides or
has its principal place of business, or for the District of Co-
lumbia, for an order setting aside, limiting, or suspending



45

the effectiveness or enforcement of the order, and the court
shall have jurisdiction to enter such an order. A respond-
ent served with a temporary cease-and-desist order en-
tered without a prior Commission hearing may not apply
to the court except after hearing and decision by the Com-
mission on the respondent’s application under subpara-
graph (A) of this paragraph.

(C) NO AUTOMATIC STAY OF TEMPORARY ORDER.—The
commencement of proceedings under subparagraph (B) of
this paragraph shall not, unless specifically ordered by the
court, operate as a stay of the Commission’s order.

(D) EXCLUSIVE REVIEW.—Section 43 of this title shall not
apply to a temporary order entered pursuant to this sec-
tion.

(5) AUTHORITY TO ENTER AN ORDER REQUIRING AN ACCOUNT-
ING AND DISGORGEMENT.—In any cease-and-desist proceeding
under subsection (f)(1), the Commission may enter an order re-
quiring accounting and disgorgement, including reasonable in-
terest. The Commission is authorized to adopt rules, regula-
tions, and orders concerning payments to investors, rates of in-
terest, periods of accrual, and such other matters as it deems
appropriate to implement this subsection.

(g) For the purposes of this section, the term “investment ad-
viser” includes a corporate or other trustee performing the func-
tions of an investment adviser.

* * * & * * *

ENFORCEMENT OF TITLE

SEC. 42. (a) The Commission may make such investigations as it
deems necessary to determine whether any person has violated or
is about to violate any provision of this title or of any rule, regula-
tion, or order hereunder, or to determine whether any action in any
court or any proceeding before the Commission shall be instituted
under this title against a particular person or persons, or with re-
spect to a particular transaction or transactions. The Commission
shall permit any person to file with it a statement in writing,
under oath or otherwise as the Commission shall determine, as to
all the facts and circumstances concerning the matter to be inves-
tigated.

(b) For the purpose of any investigation or any other proceeding
under this title, any member of the Commission, or any officer
thereof designated by it, is empowered to administer oaths and af-
firmations, subpena witnesses, compel their attendance, take evi-
dence, and require the production of any books, papers, correspond-
ence, memoranda, contracts, agreements, or other records which
are relevant or material to the inquiry. Such attendance of wit-
nesses and the production of any such records may be required
from any place in any State or in any Territory or other place sub-
ject to the jurisdiction of the United States at any designated place
of hearing.

(¢) In case of contumacy by, or refusal to obey a subpena issued
to, any person, the Commission may invoke the aid of any court of
the United States within the jurisdiction of which such investiga-
tion or proceeding is carried on, or where such person resides or



46

carries on business, in requiring the attendance and testimony of
witnesses and the production of books, papers, correspondence,
memoranda, contracts, agreements, and other records. And such
court may issue an order requiring such person to appear before
the Commission or member or officer designated by the Commis-
sion, there to produce records, if so ordered, or to give testimony
touching the matter under investigation or in question; any failure
to obey such order of the court may be punished by such court as
a contempt thereof. All process in any such case may be served in
the judicial district whereof such person is an inhabitant or wher-
ever he may be found. Any person who without just cause shall fail
or refuse to attend and testify or to answer any lawful inquiry or
to produce books, papers, correspondence, memoranda, contracts,
agreements, or other records, if in his or its power so to do, in obe-
dience to the subpena of the Commission, shall be guilty of a mis-
demeanor, and upon conviction shall be subject to a fine of not
more than $1,000 or to imprisonment for a term of not more than
one year, or both.

(d) Whenever it shall appear to the Commission that any person
has engaged or is about to engage in any act or practice consti-
tuting a violation of any provision of this title, or of any rule, regu-
lation, or order hereunder, it may in its discretion bring an action
in the proper district court of the United States, or the proper
United States court of any Territory or other place subject to the
jurisdiction of the United States, to enjoin such acts or practices
and to enforce compliance with this title or any rule, regulation, or
order hereunder. Upon a showing that such person has engaged or
is about to engage in any such act or practice, a permanent or tem-
porary injunction or decree or restraining order shall be granted
without bond. In any proceeding under this subsection to enforce
compliance with section 7, the court as a court of equity may, to
the extent it deems necessary or appropriate, take exclusive juris-
diction and possession of the investment company or companies in-
volved and the books, records, and assets thereof, wherever located;
and the court shall have jurisdiction to appoint a trustee, who with
the approval of the court shall have power to dispose of any or all
of such assets, subject to such terms and conditions as the court
may prescribe. The Commission may transmit such evidence as
may be available concerning any violation of the provisions of this
title, or of any rule, regulation, or order thereunder, to the Attor-
ney General, who, in his discretion, may institute the appropriate
criminal proceedings under this title.

(e) MONEY PENALTIES IN CIVIL ACTIONS.—

(1) AUTHORITY OF COMMISSION.—Whenever it shall appear to
the Commission that any person has violated any provision of
this title, the rules or regulations thereunder, a Federal court
injunction or a bar obtained or entered by the Commission
under this title, or a cease-and-desist order entered by the
Commission pursuant to section 9(f) of this title, the Commis-
sion may bring an action in a United States district court to
seek, and the court shall have jurisdiction to impose, upon a
proper showing, a civil penalty to be paid by the person who
committed such violation.

(2) AMOUNT OF PENALTY.—



47

(A) FIRST TIER.—The amount of the penalty shall be de-
termined by the court in light of the facts and cir-
cumstances. For each violation, the amount of the penalty
shall not exceed the greater of (i) [$5,000] $10,000 for a
natural person or [$50,0001 $100,000 for any other per-
son, or (11) the gross amount of pecuniary gain to such de-
fendant as a result of the violation.

(B) SECcOND TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraph (A),
the amount of penalty for each such violation shall not ex-
ceed the greater of (i) [$50,0001 $100,000 for a natural
person or [$250,000] $500,000 for any other person, or (ii)
the gross amount of pecuniary gain to such defendant as
a result of the violation, if the violation described in para-
graph (1) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or delib-
erate or reckless disregard of a regulatory requirement.

[(C) THIRD TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A)
and (B), the amount of penalty for each such violation
shall not exceed the greater of (i) $100,000 for a natural
person or $500,000 for any other person, or (ii) the gross
amount of pecuniary gain to such defendant as a result of
the violation, if—

[(I) the violation described in paragraph (1) involved
fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate or reckless
disregard of a regulatory requirement; and

[(II) such violation directly or indirectly resulted in
substantial losses or created a significant risk of sub-
stantial losses to other persons.]

(C) THIRD TIER.—

(i) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs
(A) and (B), for a third tier violation, the amount of
penalty for each such violation shall not exceed the
greater of—

() $1,000,000 for a natural person or
$10,000,000 for any other person;

(II) 3 times the gross amount of pecuniary gain
to the person who committed the violation; or

(I1I) the amount of losses incurred by victims as
a result of the violation.

(it) THIRD TIER VIOLATION.—For the purposes of this
subparagraph, the term “third tier violation” means a
violation described in paragraph (1) that—

(D involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or de-
liberate or reckless disregard of a regulatory re-
quirement; and

(I1) directly or indirectly—

(aa) resulted in substantial losses to other
persons;

(bb) created a significant risk of substantial
losses to other persons; or

(ce) resulted in substantial pecuniary gain to
the person who committed the violation.

(D) FOURTH TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A),
(B), and (C), the maximum amount of penalty for each such
violation shall be 3 times the otherwise applicable amount
in such subparagraphs if, within the 5-year period pre-



48

ceding such violation, the defendant was criminally con-
victed for securities fraud or became subject to a judgment
or order imposing monetary, equitable, or administrative
relief in any Commission action alleging fraud by that de-
fendant.

(3) PROCEDURES FOR COLLECTION.—

(A) PAYMENT OF PENALTY TO TREASURY.—A penalty im-
posed under this section shall be payable into the Treasury
of the United States, except as otherwise provided in sec-
tion 308 of the Sarbanes-Oxley Act of 2002 and section 21F
of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934.

(B) COLLECTION OF PENALTIES.—If a person upon whom
such a penalty is imposed shall fail to pay such penalty
within the time prescribed in the court’s order, the Com-
mission may refer the matter to the Attorney General who
shall recover such penalty by action in the appropriate
United States district court.

(C) REMEDY NOT EXCLUSIVE.—The actions authorized by
this subsection may be brought in addition to any other ac-
tion that the Commission or the Attorney General is enti-
tled to bring.

(D) JURISDICTION AND VENUE.—For purposes of section
44 of this title, actions under this paragraph shall be ac-
tions to enforce a liability or a duty created by this title.

[(4) SPECIAL PROVISIONS RELATING TO A VIOLATION OF A
CEASE-AND-DESIST ORDER.—In an action to enforce a cease-and-
desist order entered by the Commission pursuant to section
9(f), each separate violation of such order shall be a separate
offense, except that in the case of a violation through a con-
tinuing failure to comply with the order, each day of the failure
to comply shall be deemed a separate offense.]

(4) SPECIAL PROVISIONS RELATING TO A VIOLATION OF AN IN-
JUNCTION OR CERTAIN ORDERS.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—Each separate violation of an injunc-
tion or order described in subparagraph (B) shall be a sep-
arate offense, except that in the case of a violation through
a continuing failure to comply with such injunction or
order, each day of the failure to comply with the injunction
or order shall be deemed a separate offense.

(B) INJUNCTIONS AND ORDERS.—Subparagraph (A) shall
apply with respect to any action to enforce—

(i) a Federal court injunction obtained pursuant to
this title;

(it) an order entered or obtained by the Commission
pursuant to this title that bars, suspends, places limi-
tations on the activities or functions of, or prohibits the
activities of a person; or

(iii) a cease-and-desist order entered by the Commis-
sion pursuant to section 9(f).

* * *k & * * *k



49
INVESTMENT ADVISERS ACT OF 1940
TITLE II-INVESTMENT ADVISERS

* * *k & * * *k

REGISTRATION OF INVESTMENT ADVISERS

SEC. 203. (a) Except as provided in subsection (b) and section
2034, it shall be unlawful for any investment adviser, unless reg-
istered under this section, to make use of the mails or any means
or instrumentality of interstate commerce in connection with his or
its business as an investment adviser.

(b) The provisions of subsection (a) shall not apply to—

(1) any investment adviser, other than an investment ad-
viser who acts as an investment adviser to any private fund,
all of whose clients are residents of the State within which
such investment adviser maintains his or its principal office
and place of business, and who does not furnish advice or issue
analyses or reports with respect to securities listed or admitted
to unlisted trading privileges on any national securities ex-
change;

(2) any investment adviser whose only clients are insurance
companies;

(3) any investment adviser that is a foreign private adviser;

(4) any investment adviser that is a charitable organization,
as defined in section 3(c)(10)(D) of the Investment Company
Act of 1940, or is a trustee, director, officer, employee, or vol-
unteer of such a charitable organization acting within the
scope of such person’s employment or duties with such organi-
zation, whose advice, analyses, or reports are provided only to
one or more of the following:

(A) any such charitable organization;

(B) a fund that is excluded from the definition of an in-
vestment company under section 3(c)(10)(B) of the Invest-
ment Company Act of 1940; or

(C) a trust or other donative instrument described in
section 3(c)(10)(B) of the Investment Company Act of 1940,
or the trustees, administrators, settlors (or potential set-
tlors), or beneficiaries of any such trust or other instru-
ment;

(5) any plan described in section 414(e) of the Internal Rev-
enue Code of 1986, any person or entity eligible to establish
and maintain such a plan under the Internal Revenue Code of
1986, or any trustee, director, officer, or employee of or volun-
teer for any such plan or person, if such person or entity, act-
ing in such capacity, provides investment advice exclusively to,
or with respect to, any plan, person, or entity or any company,
account, or fund that is excluded from the definition of an in-
vestment company under section 3(c)(14) of the Investment
Company Act of 1940;

(6)(A) any investment adviser that is registered with the
Commodity Futures Trading Commission as a commodity trad-
ing advisor whose business does not consist primarily of acting
as an investment adviser, as defined in section 202(a)(11) of
this title, and that does not act as an investment adviser to—



50

A (i) an investment company registered under title I of this
ct; or

(i1) a company which has elected to be a business devel-
opment company pursuant to section 54 of title I of this
Act and has not withdrawn its election; or

(B) any investment adviser that is registered with the Com-
modity Futures Trading Commission as a commodity trading
advisor and advises a private fund, provided that, if after the
date of enactment of the Private Fund Investment Advisers
Registration Act of 2010, the business of the advisor should be-
come predominately the provision of securities-related advice,
then such adviser shall register with the Commission;

(7) any investment adviser, other than any entity that has
elected to be regulated or is regulated as a business develop-
ment company pursuant to section 54 of the Investment Com-
pany Act of 1940 (15 U.S.C. 80a—54), who solely advises—

(A) small business investment companies that are licens-
ees under the Small Business Investment Act of 1958;

(B) entities that have received from the Small Business
Administration notice to proceed to qualify for a license as
a small business investment company under the Small
Business Investment Act of 1958, which notice or license
has not been revoked; or

(C) applicants that are affiliated with 1 or more licensed
small business investment companies described in sub-
paragraph (A) and that have applied for another license
under the Small Business Investment Act of 1958, which
application remains pending; or

(8) any investment adviser, other than an entity that has
elected to be regulated or is regulated as a business develop-
ment company pursuant to section 54 of the Investment Com-
pany Act of 1940 (15 U.S.C. 80a—53), who solely advises—

(A) rural business investment companies (as defined in
section 384A of the Consolidated Farm and Rural Develop-
ment Act (7 U.S.C. 2009cc)); or

(B) companies that have submitted to the Secretary of
Agriculture an application in accordance with section
384D(b) of the Consolidated Farm and Rural Development
Act (7 U.S.C. 2009cc-3(b)) that—

(i) have received from the Secretary of Agriculture a

letter of conditions, which has not been revoked; or
(ii) are affiliated with 1 or more rural business in-

vestment companies described in subparagraph (A).
(c)(1) An investment adviser, or any person who presently con-
templates becoming an investment adviser, may be registered by
filing with the Commission an application for registration in such
form and containing such of the following information and docu-
ments as the Commission, by rule, may prescribe as necessary or
appropriate in the public interest or for the protection of investors:

(A) the name and form of organization under which the in-
vestment adviser engages or intends to engage in business; the
name of the State or other sovereign power under which such
investment adviser is organized; the location of his or its prin-
cipal office, principal place of business, and branch offices, if
any; the names and addresses of his or its partners, officers,



51

directors, and persons performing similar functions or, if such
an investment adviser be an individual, of such individual; and
the number of his or its employees;

(B) the education, the business affiliations for the past ten
years, and the present business affiliations of such investment
adviser and of his or its partners, officers, directors, and per-
sons performing similar functions and of any controlling person
thereof;

(C) the nature of the business of such investment adviser, in-
cluding the manner of giving advice and rendering analyses or
reports;

(D) a balance sheet certified by an independent public ac-
countant and other financial statements (which shall, as the
Commission specifies, be certified);

(E) the nature and scope of the authority of such investment
adviser with respect to clients’ funds and accounts;

(F) the basis or bases upon which such investment adviser
is compensated;

(G) whether such investment adviser, or any person associ-
ated with such investment adviser, is subject to any disquali-
fication which would be a basis for denial, suspension, or rev-
ocation of registration of such investment adviser under the
provisions of subsection (e) of this section; and

(H) a statement as to whether the principal business of such
investment adviser consists or is to consist of acting as invest-
ment adviser and a statement as to whether a substantial part
of the business of such investment adviser, consists or is to
consist of rendering investment supervisory services.

(2) Within forty-five days of the date of the filing of such applica-
tion (or within such longer period as to which the applicant con-
sents) the Commission shall—

(A) by order grant such registration; or

(B) institute proceedings to determine whether registration
should be denied. Such proceedings shall include notice of the
grounds for denial under consideration and opportunity for
hearing and shall be concluded within one hundred twenty
days of the date of the filing of the application for registration.
At the conclusion of such proceedings the Commission, by
order, shall grant or deny such registration. The Commission
may extend the time for conclusion of such proceedings for up
to ninety days if it finds good cause for such extension and
publishes its reasons for so finding or for such longer period as
to which the applicant consents.

The Commission shall grant such registration if the Commission
finds that the requirements of this section are satisfied and that
the applicant is not prohibited from registering as an investment
adviser under section 203A. The Commission shall deny such reg-
istration if it does not make such a finding or if it finds that if the
applicant were so registered, its registration would be subject to
suspension or revocation under subsection (e) of this section.

(d) Any provision of this title (other than subsection (a) of this
section) which prohibits any act, practice, or course of business if
the mails or any means or instrumentality of interstate commerce
are used in connection therewith shall also prohibit any such act,
practice, or course of business by any investment adviser registered



52

pursuant to this section or any person acting on behalf of such an
investment adviser, irrespective of any use of the mails or any
means or instrumentality of interstate commerce in connection
therewith.

(e) The Commission, by order, shall censure, place limitations on
the activities, functions, or operations of, suspend for a period not
exceeding twelve months, or revoke the registration of any invest-
ment adviser if it finds, on the record after notice and opportunity
for hearing, that such censure, placing of limitations, suspension,
or revocation is in the public interest and that such investment ad-
viser, or any person associated with such investment adviser,
whether prior to or subsequent to becoming so associated—

(1) has willfully made or caused to be made in any applica-
tion for registration or report required to be filed with the
Commission under this title, or in any proceeding before the
Commission with respect to registration, any statement which
was at the time and in the light of the circumstances under
which it was made false or misleading with respect to any ma-
terial fact, or has omitted to state in any such application or
report any material fact which is required to be stated therein.

(2) has been convicted within ten years preceding the filing
of any application for registration or at any time thereafter of
any felony or misdemeanor or of a substantially equivalent
crime by a foreign court of competent jurisdiction which the
Commission finds—

(A) involves the purchase or sale of any security, the
taking of a false oath, the making of a false report, brib-
ery, perjury, burglary, any substantially equivalent activ-
ity however denominated by the laws of the relevant for-
?ign government, or conspiracy to commit any such of-
ense;

(B) arises out of the conduct of the business of a broker,
dealer, municipal securities dealer, investment adviser,
bank, insurance company, government securities broker,
government securities dealer, fiduciary, transfer agent,
credit rating agency, foreign person performing a function
substantially equivalent to any of the above, or entity or
person required to be registered under the Commodity Ex-
1change Act or any substantially equivalent statute or regu-
ation;

(C) involves the larceny, theft, robbery, extortion, for-
gery, counterfeiting, fraudulent concealment, embezzle-
ment, fraudulent conversion, or misappropriation of funds
or securities or substantially equivalent activity however
denominated by the laws of the relevant foreign govern-
ment; or

(D) involves the violation of section 152, 1341, 1342, or
1343 or chapter 25 or 47 of title 18, United States Code,
or a violation of substantially equivalent foreign statute.

(3) has been convicted during the 10-year period preceding
the date of filing of any application for registration, or at any
time thereafter, of—

(A) any crime that is punishable by imprisonment for 1
or more years, and that is not described in paragraph (2);
or



53

(B) a substantially equivalent crime by a foreign court of
competent jurisdiction.

(4) is permanently or temporarily enjoined by order, judg-
ment, or decree of any court of competent jurisdiction, includ-
ing any foreign court of competent jurisdiction, from acting as
an investment adviser, underwriter, broker, dealer, municipal
securities dealer, government securities broker, government se-
curities dealer, transfer agent, credit rating agency, foreign
person performing a function substantially equivalent to any of
the above, or entity or person required to be registered under
the Commodity Exchange Act or any substantially equivalent
statute or regulation, or as an affiliated person or employee of
any investment company, bank, insurance company, foreign
entity substantially equivalent to any of the above, or entity or
person required to be registered under the Commodity Ex-
change Act or any substantially equivalent statute or regula-
tion, or from engaging in or continuing any conduct or practice
in connection with any such activity, or in connection with the
purchase or sale of any security.

(5) has willfully violated any provision of the Securities Act
of 1933, the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, the Investment
Company Act of 1940, this title, the Commodity Exchange Act,
or the rules or regulations under any such statutes or any rule
of the Municipal Securities Rulemaking Board, or is unable to
comply with any such provision.

(6) has willfully aided, abetted, counseled, commanded, in-
duced, or procured the violation by any other person of any
provision of the Securities Act of 1933, the Securities Exchange
Act of 1934, the Investment Company Act of 1940, this title,
the Commodity Exchange Act, the rules or regulations under
any of such statutes, or the rules of the Municipal Securities
Rulemaking Board, or has failed reasonably to supervise, with
a view to preventing violations of the provisions of such stat-
utes, rules, and regulations, another person who commits such
a violation, if such other person is subject to his supervision.
For the purposes of this paragraph no person shall be deemed
to have failed reasonably to supervise any person, if—

(A) there have been established procedures, and a sys-
tem for applying such procedures, which would reasonably
be expected to prevent and detect, insofar as practicable,
any such violation by such other person, and

(B) such person has reasonably discharged the duties
and obligations incumbent upon him by reason of such pro-
cedures and system without reasonable cause to believe
tha}‘g1 such procedures and system were not being complied
with.

(7) is subject to any order of the Commission barring or sus-
pending the right of the person to be associated with an invest-
ment adviser;

(8) has been found by a foreign financial regulatory authority
to have—

(A) made or caused to be made in any application for
registration or report required to be filed with a foreign se-
curities authority, or in any proceeding before a foreign se-
curities authority with respect to registration, any state-



54

ment that was at the time and in light of the cir-
cumstances under which it was made false or misleading
with respect to any material fact, or has omitted to state
in any application or report to a foreign securities author-
ity any material fact that is required to be stated therein;

(B) violated any foreign statute or regulation regarding
transactions in securities or contracts of sale of a com-
modity for future delivery traded on or subject to the rules
of a contract market or any board of trade; or

(C) aided, abetted, counseled, commanded, induced, or
procured the violation by any other person of any foreign
statute or regulation regarding transactions in securities
or contracts of sale of a commodity for future delivery trad-
ed on or subject to the rules of a contract market or any
board of trade, or has been found, by the foreign finanical
regulatory authority, to have failed reasonably to super-
vise, with a view to preventing violations of statutory pro-
visions, and rules and regulations promulgated there-
under, another person who commits such a violation, if
such other person is subject to his supervision; or

(9) is subject to any final order of a State securities commis-
sion (or any agency or officer performing like functions), State
authority that supervises or examines banks, savings associa-
tions, or credit unions, State insurance commission (or any
agency or office performing like functions), an appropriate Fed-
eral banking agency (as defined in section 3 of the Federal De-
posit Insurance Act (12 U.S.C. 1813(q))), or the National Credit
Union Administration, that—

(A) bars such person from association with an entity reg-
ulated by such commission, authority, agency, or officer, or
from engaging in the business of securities, insurance,
banking, savings association activities, or credit union ac-
tivities; or

(B) constitutes a final order based on violations of any
laws or regulations that prohibit fraudulent, manipulative,
or deceptive conduct.

(f) The Commission, by order, shall censure or place limitations
on the activities of any person associated, seeking to become associ-
ated, or, at the time of the alleged misconduct, associated or seek-
ing to become associated with an investment adviser, or suspend
for a period not exceeding 12 months or bar any such person from
being associated with an investment adviser, broker, dealer, munic-
ipal securities dealer, municipal advisor, transfer agent, or nation-
ally recognized statistical rating organization, if the Commission
finds, on the record after notice and opportunity for hearing, that
such censure, placing of limitations, suspension, or bar is in the
public interest and that such person has committed or omitted any
act or omission enumerated in paragraph (1), (5), (6), (8), or (9) of
subsection (e) or has been convicted of any offense specified in
paragraph (2) or (3) of subsection (e) within ten years of the com-
mencement of the proceedings under this subsection, or is enjoined
from any action, conduct, or practice specified in paragraph (4) of
subsection (e). It shall be unlawful for any person as to whom such
an order suspending or barring him from being associated with an
investment adviser is in effect willfully to become, or to be, associ-



55

ated with an investment adviser without the consent of the Com-
mission, and it shall be unlawful for any investment adviser to per-
mit such a person to become, or remain, a person associated with
him without the consent of the Commission, if such investment ad-
viser knew, or in the exercise of reasonable care, should have
known, of such order.

(g) Any successor to the business of an investment adviser reg-
istered under this section shall be deemed likewise registered here-
under, if within thirty days from its succession to such business it
shall file an application for registration under this section, unless
and until the Commission, pursuant to subsection (c¢c) or subsection
(e) of this section, shall deny registration to or revoke or suspend
the registration of such successor.

(h) Any person registered under this section may, upon such
terms and conditions as the Commission finds necessary in the
public interest or for the protection of investors, withdraw from
registration by filing a written notice of withdrawal with the Com-
mission. If the Commission finds that any person registered under
this section, or who has pending an application for registration
filed under this section, is no longer in existence, is not engaged
in business as an investment adviser, or is prohibited from reg-
istering as an investment adviser under section 203A, the Commis-
sion shall by order cancel the registration of such person.

(i) MONEY PENALTIES IN ADMINISTRATIVE PROCEEDINGS.—

(1) AUTHORITY OF COMMISSION.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—In any proceeding instituted pursuant
to subsection (e) or (f) against any person, the Commission
may impose a civil penalty if it finds, on the record after
notice and opportunity for hearing, that such penalty is in
the public interest and that such person—

(i) has willfully violated any provision of the Securi-
ties Act of 1933, the Securities Exchange Act of 1934,
the Investment Company Act of 1940, or this title, or
the rules or regulations thereunder;

(i1) has willfully aided, abetted, counseled, com-
manded, induced, or procured such a violation by any
other person;

(iii) has willfully made or caused to be made in any
application for registration or report required to be
filed with the Commission under this title, or in any
proceeding before the Commission with respect to reg-
istration, any statement which was, at the time and in
the light of the circumstances under which it was
made, false or misleading with respect to any material
fact, or has omitted to state in any such application or
report any material fact which was required to be stat-
ed therein; or

(iv) has failed reasonably to supervise, within the
meaning of subsection (e)(6), with a view to preventing
violations of the provisions of this title and the rules
and regulations thereunder, another person who com-
mits such a violation, if such other person is subject
to his supervision;

(B) CEASE-AND-DESIST PROCEEDINGS.—In any proceeding
instituted pursuant to subsection (k) against any person,



56

the Commission may impose a civil penalty if the Commis-
sion finds, on the record, after notice and opportunity for
hearing, that such person—

(1) is violating or has violated any provision of this
title, or any rule or regulation issued under this title;
or

(ii) is or was a cause of the violation of any provision
of this title, or any rule or regulation issued under this
title.

(2) MAXIMUM AMOUNT OF PENALTY.—

(A) FIRST TIER.—The maximum amount of penalty for
each act or omission described in paragraph (1) shall be
[$5,000] $10,000 for a natural person or [$50,0001
$100,000 for any other person.

(B) SEcOND TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraph (A),
the maximum amount of penalty for each such act or omis-
sion shall be [$50,000]1 $100,000 for a natural person or
[$250,0001 $500,000 for any other person if the act or
omission described in paragraph (1) involved fraud, deceit,
manipulation, or deliberate or reckless disregard of a regu-
latory requirement.

[(C) THIRD TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A)
and (B), the maximum amount of penalty for each such act
or omission shall be $100,000 for a natural person or
$500,000 for any other person if—

[(@) the act or omission described in paragraph (1)
involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate or
reckless disregard of a regulatory requirement; and

[(ii) such act or omission directly or indirectly re-
sulted in substantial losses or created a significant
risk of substantial losses to other persons or resulted
in substantial pecuniary gain to the person who com-
mitted the act or omission. ]

(C) THIRD TIER.—

(i) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs
(A) and (B), for a third tier act or omission, the
amount of penalty for each such act or omission shall
not exceed the greater of—

() $1,000,000 for a natural person or
$10,000,000 for any other person;

(II) 3 times the gross amount of pecuniary gain
to the person who committed the act or omission;
or

(IID) the amount of losses incurred by victims as
a result of the act or omission.

(ii) THIRD TIER ACT OR OMISSION.—For the purposes
of this subparagraph, the term “third tier act or omis-
sion” means an act or omission described in paragraph
(D that—

(D) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or de-
liberate or reckless disregard of a regulatory re-
quirement; and

(II) directly or indirectly—

(aa) resulted in substantial losses to other
persons;



57

(bb) created a significant risk of substantial
losses to other persons; or

(cc) resulted in substantial pecuniary gain to
the person who committed the act or omission.

(D) FOURTH TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A),
(B), and (C), the maximum amount of penalty for each such
act or omission shall be 3 times the otherwise applicable
amount in such subparagraphs if, within the 5-year period
preceding such act or omission, the person who committed
the act or omission was criminally convicted for securities
fraud or became subject to a judgment or order imposing
monetary, equitable, or administrative relief in any Com-
mission action alleging fraud by that person.

(3) DETERMINATION OF PUBLIC INTEREST.—In considering
under this section whether a penalty is in the public interest,
the Commission may consider—

(A) whether the act or omission for which such penalty
is assessed involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or delib-
erate or reckless disregard of a regulatory requirement;

(B) the harm to other persons resulting either directly or
indirectly from such act or omission,;

(C) the extent to which any person was unjustly en-
riched, taking into account any restitution made to persons
injured by such behavior;

(D) whether such person previously has been found by
the Commission, another appropriate regulatory agency, or
a self-regulatory organization to have violated the Federal
securities laws, State securities laws, or the rules of a self-
regulatory organization, has been enjoined by a court of
competent jurisdiction from violations of such laws or
rules, or has been convicted by a court of competent juris-
diction of violations of such laws or of any felony or mis-
demeanor described in section 203(e)(2) of this title;

(E) the need to deter such person and other persons from
committing such acts or omissions; and

(F) such other matters as justice may require.

(4) EVIDENCE CONCERNING ABILITY TO PAY.—In any pro-
ceeding in which the Commission may impose a penalty under
this section, a respondent may present evidence of the respond-
ent’s ability to pay such penalty. The Commission may, in its
discretion, consider such evidence in determining whether such
penalty is in the public interest. Such evidence may relate to
the extent of such person’s ability to continue in business and
the collectability of a penalty, taking into account any other
claims of the United States or third parties upon such person’s
assets and the amount of such person’s assets.

(G) AUTHORITY TO ENTER AN ORDER REQUIRING AN ACCOUNTING
AND DISGORGEMENT.—In any proceeding in which the Commission
may impose a penalty under this section, the Commission may
enter an order requiring accounting and disgorgement, including
reasonable interest. The Commission is authorized to adopt rules,
regulations, and orders concerning payments to investors, rates of
interest, periods of accrual, and such other matters as it deems ap-
propriate to implement this subsection.

(k) CEASE-AND-DESIST PROCEEDINGS.—



58

(1) AUTHORITY OF THE COMMISSION.—If the Commission
finds, after notice and opportunity for hearing, that any person
is violating, has violated, or is about to violate any provision
of this title, or any rule or regulation thereunder, the Commis-
sion may publish its findings and enter an order requiring
such person, and any other person that is, was, or would be a
cause of the violation, due to an act or omission the person
knew or should have known would contribute to such violation,
to cease and desist from committing or causing such violation
and any future violation of the same provision, rule, or regula-
tion. Such order may, in addition to requiring a person to cease
and desist from committing or causing a violation, require such
person to comply, or to take steps to effect compliance, with
such provision, rule, or regulation, upon such terms and condi-
tions and within such time as the Commission may specify in
such order. Any such order may, as the Commission deems ap-
propriate, require future compliance or steps to effect future
compliance, either permanently or for such period of time as
the Commission may specify, with such provision, rule, or reg-
ulation with respect to any security, any issuer, or any other
person.

(2) HEARING.—The notice instituting proceedings pursuant to
paragraph (1) shall fix a hearing date not earlier than 30 days
nor later than 60 days after service of the notice unless an ear-
lier or a later date is set by the Commission with the consent
of any respondent so served.

(3) TEMPORARY ORDER.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—Whenever the Commission determines
that the alleged violation or threatened violation specified
in the notice instituting proceedings pursuant to para-
graph (1), or the continuation thereof, is likely to result in
significant dissipation or conversion of assets, significant
harm to investors, or substantial harm to the public inter-
est, including, but not limited to, losses to the Securities
Investor Protection Corporation, prior to the completion of
the proceedings, the Commission may enter a temporary
order requiring the respondent to cease and desist from
the violation or threatened violation and to take such ac-
tion to prevent the violation or threatened violation and to
prevent dissipation or conversion of assets, significant
harm to investors, or substantial harm to the public inter-
est as the Commission deems appropriate pending comple-
tion of such proceedings. Such an order shall be entered
only after notice and opportunity for a hearing, unless the
Commission, notwithstanding section 211(c) of this title,
determines that notice and hearing prior to entry would be
impracticable or contrary to the public interest. A tem-
porary order shall become effective upon service upon the
respondent and, unless set aside, limited, or suspended by
the Commission or a court of competent jurisdiction, shall
remain effective and enforceable pending the completion of
the proceedings.

(B) AppPLICABILITY.—This paragraph shall apply only to
a respondent that acts, or, at the time of the alleged mis-
conduct acted, as a broker, dealer, investment adviser, in-



59

vestment company, municipal securities dealer, govern-
ment securities broker, government securities dealer, or
transfer agent, or is, or was at the time of the alleged mis-
conduct, an associated person of, or a person seeking to be-
come associated with, any of the foregoing.

(4) REVIEW OF TEMPORARY ORDERS.—

(A) COMMISSION REVIEW.—At any time after the re-
spondent has been served with a temporary cease-and-de-
sist order pursuant to paragraph (3), the respondent may
apply to the Commission to have the order set aside, lim-
ited, or suspended. If the respondent has been served with
a temporary cease-and-desist order entered without a prior
Commission hearing, the respondent may, within 10 days
after the date on which the order was served, request a
hearing on such application and the Commission shall hold
a hearing and render a decision on such application at the
earliest possible time.

(B) JuDICIAL REVIEW.—Within—

(i) 10 days after the date the respondent was served
with a temporary cease-and-desist order entered with
a prior Commission hearing, or
(ii) 10 days after the Commission renders a decision
on an application and hearing under subparagraph
(A), with respect to any temporary cease-and-desist
order entered without a prior Commission hearing,
the respondent may apply to the United States district
court for the district in which the respondent resides or
has its principal office or place of business, or for the Dis-
trict of Columbia, for an order setting aside, limiting, or
suspending the effectiveness or enforcement of the order,
and the court shall have jurisdiction to enter such an
order. A respondent served with a temporary cease-and-de-
sist order entered without a prior Commission hearing
may not apply to the court except after hearing and deci-
sion by the Commission on the respondent’s application
under subparagraph (A) of this paragraph.

(C) NO AUTOMATIC STAY OF TEMPORARY ORDER.—The
commencement of proceedings under subparagraph (B) of
this paragraph shall not, unless specifically ordered by the
court, operate as a stay of the Commission’s order.

(D) EXCLUSIVE REVIEW.—Section 213 of this title shall
not apply to a temporary order entered pursuant to this
section.

(5) AUTHORITY TO ENTER AN ORDER REQUIRING AN ACCOUNT-
ING AND DISGORGEMENT.—In any cease-and-desist proceeding
under paragraph (1), the Commission may enter an order re-
quiring accounting and disgorgement, including reasonable in-
terest. The Commission is authorized to adopt rules, regula-
tions, and orders concerning payments to investors, rates of in-
terest, periods of accrual, and such other matters as it deems
appropriate to implement this subsection.

() EXEMPTION OF VENTURE CAPITAL FUND ADVISERS.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—No investment adviser that acts as an in-
vestment adviser solely to 1 or more venture capital funds
shall be subject to the registration requirements of this title



60

with respect to the provision of investment advice relating to
a venture capital fund. Not later than 1 year after the date of
enactment of this subsection, the Commission shall issue final
rules to define the term “venture capital fund” for purposes of
this subsection. The Commission shall require such advisers to
maintain such records and provide to the Commission such an-
nual or other reports as the Commission determines necessary
or appropriate in the public interest or for the protection of in-
vestors.

(2) ADVISERS OF SBICS.—For purposes of this subsection, a
venture capital fund includes an entity described in subpara-
graph (A), (B), or (C) of subsection (b)(7) (other than an entity
that has elected to be regulated or is regulated as a business
development company pursuant to section 54 of the Investment
Company Act of 1940).

(3) ADVISERS OF RBICS.—For purposes of this subsection, a
venture capital fund includes an entity described in subpara-
graph (A) or (B) of subsection (b)(8) (other than an entity that
has elected to be regulated as a business development company
pursuant to section 54 of the Investment Company Act of 1940
(15 U.S.C. 80a-53)).

(m) EXEMPTION OF AND REPORTING BY CERTAIN PRIVATE FUND
ADVISERS.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The Commission shall provide an exemp-
tion from the registration requirements under this section to
any investment adviser of private funds, if each of such invest-
ment adviser acts solely as an adviser to private funds and has
assets under management in the United States of less than
$150,000,000.

(2) REPORTING.—The Commission shall require investment
advisers exempted by reason of this subsection to maintain
such records and provide to the Commission such annual or
other reports as the Commission determines necessary or ap-
propriate in the public interest or for the protection of inves-
tors.

(8) ADVISERS OF SBICS.—For purposes of this subsection, the
assets under management of a private fund that is an entity
described in subparagraph (A), (B), or (C) of subsection (b)(7)
(other than an entity that has elected to be regulated or is reg-
ulated as a business development company pursuant to section
54 of the Investment Company Act of 1940) shall be excluded
from the limit set forth in paragraph (1).

(4) ADVISERS OF RBICS.—For purposes of this subsection, the
assets under management of a private fund that is an entity
described in subparagraph (A) or (B) of subsection (b)(8) (other
than an entity that has elected to be regulated or is regulated
as a business development company pursuant to section 54 of
the Investment Company Act of 1940 (15 U.S.C. 80a—-53)) shall
be excluded from the limit set forth in paragraph (1).

(n) REGISTRATION AND EXAMINATION OF MID-SIZED PRIVATE FUND
ADVISERS.—In prescribing regulations to carry out the require-
ments of this section with respect to investment advisers acting as
investment advisers to mid-sized private funds, the Commission
shall take into account the size, governance, and investment strat-
egy of such funds to determine whether they pose systemic risk,



61

and shall provide for registration and examination procedures with
respect to the investment advisers of such funds which reflect the
level of systemic risk posed by such funds.

* * *k & * * *k

ENFORCEMENT OF TITLE

SEcC. 209. (a) Whenever it shall appear to the Commission, either
upon complaint or otherwise, that the provisions of this title or of
any rule or regulation prescribed under the authority thereof, have
been or are about to be violated by any person, it may in its discre-
tion require, and in any event shall permit, such person to file with
it a statement in writing, under oath or otherwise, as to all the
facts and circumstances relevant to such violation, and may other-
wise investigate all such facts and circumstances.

(b) For the purposes of any investigation or any proceeding under
this title, any member of the Commission or any officer thereof des-
ignated by it is empowered to administer oaths and affirmations,
subpena witnesses, compel their attendance, take evidence, and re-
quire the production of any books, papers, correspondence, memo-
randa, contracts, agreements, or other records which are relevant
or material to the inquiry. Such attendance of witnesses and the
production of any such records may be required from any place in
any State or in any Territory or other place subject to the jurisdic-
tion of the United States at any designated place of hearing.

(c) In case of contumacy by, or refusal to obey a subpena issued
to, any person, the Commission may invoke the aid of any court of
the United States within the jurisdiction of which such investiga-
tion or proceeding is carried on, or where such person resides or
carries on business, in requiring the attendance and testimony of
witnesses and the production of books, papers, correspondence,
memoranda, contracts, agreements, and other records. And such
court may issue an order requiring such person to appear before
the Commission or member or officer designated by the Commis-
sion, there to produce records, if so ordered or to give testimony
touching the matter under investigation or in question; and any
failure to obey such order of the court may be punished by such
court as a contempt thereof. All process in any such case may be
served in the judicial district whereof such person is an inhabitant
or wherever he may be found. Any person who without just cause
shall fail or refuse to attend and testify or to answer any lawful
inquiry or to produce books, papers, correspondence, memoranda,
contracts, agreements, or other records, if in his or its power so to
do, in obedience to the subpena of the Commission, shall be guilty
of a misdemeanor, and upon conviction shall be subject to a fine
of not more than $1,000 or to imprisonment for a term of not more
than one year, or both.

(d) Whenever it shall appear to the Commission that any person
has engaged, is engaged, or is about to engage in any act or prac-
tice constituting a violation of any provision of this title, or of any
rule, regulation, or order hereunder, or that any person has aided,
abetted, counseled, commanded, induced, or procured, is aiding,
abetting, counseling, commanding, inducing, or procuring, or is
about to aid, abet, counsel, command, induce, or procure such a vio-
lation, it may in its discretion bring an action in the proper district



62

court of the United States, or the proper United States court of any
Territory or other place subject to the jurisdiction of the United
States, to enjoin such acts or practices and to enforce compliance
with this title or any rule, regulation, or order hereunder. Upon a
showing that such person has engaged, is engaged, or is about to
engage in any such act or practice, or in aiding, abetting, coun-
seling, commanding, inducing, or procuring any such act or prac-
tice, a permanent or temporary injunction or decree or restraining
order shall be granted without bond. The Commission may trans-
mit such evidence as may be available concerning any violation of
the provisions of this title, or of any rule, regulation, or order
thereunder, to the Attorney General, who, in his discretion, may in-
stitute the appropriate criminal proceedings under this title.
(e) MONEY PENALTIES IN CIVIL ACTIONS.—

(1) AUTHORITY OF COMMISSION.—Whenever it shall appear to
the Commission that any person has violated any provision of
this title, the rules or regulations thereunder, a Federal court
injunction or a bar obtained or entered by the Commission
under this title, or a cease-and-desist order entered by the
Commission pursuant to section 203(k) of this title, the Com-
mission may bring an action in a United States district court
to seek, and the court shall have jurisdiction to impose, upon
a proper showing, a civil penalty to be paid by the person who
committed such violation.

(2) AMOUNT OF PENALTY.—

(A) FIRST TIER.—The amount of the penalty shall be de-
termined by the court in light of the facts and cir-
cumstances. For each violation, the amount of the penalty
shall not exceed the greater of (i) [$5,000] $10,000 for a
natural person or [$50,0001 $100,000 for any other per-
son, or (11) the gross amount of pecuniary gain to such de-
fendant as a result of the violation.

(B) SEcOND TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraph (A),
the amount of penalty for each such violation shall not ex-
ceed the greater of (i) [$50,000]1 $100,000 for a natural
person or [$250,0001 $500,000 for any other person, or (ii)
the gross amount of pecuniary gain to such defendant as
a result of the violation, if the violation described in para-
graph (1) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or delib-
erate or reckless disregard of a regulatory requirement.

[(C) THIRD TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A)
and (B), the amount of penalty for each such violation
shall not exceed the greater of (i) $100,000 for a natural
person or $500,000 for any other person, or (ii) the gross
amount of pecuniary gain to such defendant as a result of
the violation, if—

[(I) the violation described in paragraph (1) involved
fraud, deceit, manipulation, or deliberate or reckless
disregard of a regulatory requirement; and

[(II) such violation directly or indirectly resulted in
substantial losses or created a significant risk of sub-
stantial losses to other persons.]

(C) THIRD TIER.—

(i) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs
(A) and (B), for a third tier violation, the amount of



63

penalty for each such violation shall not exceed the
greater of—

() $1,000,000 for a natural person or
$10,000,000 for any other person;

(II) 3 times the gross amount of pecuniary gain
to the person who committed the violation; or

(I1I) the amount of losses incurred by victims as
a result of the violation.

(it) THIRD TIER VIOLATION.—For the purposes of this
subparagraph, the term “third tier violation” means a
violation described in paragraph (1) that—

(D) involved fraud, deceit, manipulation, or de-
liberate or reckless disregard of a regulatory re-
quirement; and

(I1) directly or indirectly—

(aa) resulted in substantial losses to other
persons;

(bb) created a significant risk of substantial
losses to other persons; or

(cc) resulted in substantial pecuniary gain to
the person who committed the violation.

(D) FOURTH TIER.—Notwithstanding subparagraphs (A),
(B), and (C), the maximum amount of penalty for each such
violation shall be 3 times the otherwise applicable amount
in such subparagraphs if, within the 5-year period pre-
ceding such violation, the defendant was criminally con-
victed for securities fraud or became subject to a judgment
or order imposing monetary, equitable, or administrative
relief in any Commission action alleging fraud by that de-
fendant.

(3) PROCEDURES FOR COLLECTION.—

(A) PAYMENT OF PENALTY TO TREASURY.—A penalty im-
posed under this section shall be payable into the Treasury
of the United States, except as otherwise provided in sec-
tion 308 of the Sarbanes-Oxley Act of 2002 and section 21F
of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934.

(B) COLLECTION OF PENALTIES.—If a person upon whom
such a penalty is imposed shall fail to pay such penalty
within the time prescribed in the court’s order, the Com-
mission may refer the matter to the Attorney General who
shall recover such penalty by action in the appropriate
United States district court.

(C) REMEDY NOT EXCLUSIVE.—The actions authorized by
this subsection may be brought in addition to any other ac-
tion that the Commission or the Attorney General is enti-
tled to bring.

(D) JURISDICTION AND VENUE.—For purposes of section
214 of this title, actions under this paragraph shall be ac-
tions to enforce a liability or a duty created by this title.

[(4) SPECIAL PROVISIONS RELATING TO A VIOLATION OF A
CEASE-AND-DESIST ORDER.—In an action to enforce a cease-and-
desist order entered by the Commission pursuant to section
203(k), each separate violation of such order shall be a sepa-
rate offense, except that in the case of a violation through a



64

continuing failure to comply with the order, each day of the
failure to comply shall be deemed a separate offense.]

(4) SPECIAL PROVISIONS RELATING TO A VIOLATION OF AN IN-
JUNCTION OR CERTAIN ORDERS.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—Each separate violation of an injunc-
tion or order described in subparagraph (B) shall be a sep-
arate offense, except that in the case of a violation through
a continuing failure to comply with such injunction or
order, each day of the failure to comply with the injunction
or order shall be deemed a separate offense.

(B) INJUNCTIONS AND ORDERS.—Subparagraph (A) shall
apply with respect to any action to enforce—

(i) a Federal court injunction obtained pursuant to
this title;

(it) an order entered or obtained by the Commission
pursuant to this title that bars, suspends, places limi-
tations on the activities or functions of, or prohibits the
activities of a person; or

(iii) a cease-and-desist order entered by the Commis-
sion pursuant to section 203(k).

(f) AIDING AND ABETTING.—For purposes of any action brought by
the Commission under subsection (e), any person that knowingly or
recklessly has aided, abetted, counseled, commanded, induced, or
procured a violation of any provision of this Act, or of any rule, reg-
ulation, or order hereunder, shall be deemed to be in violation of
such provision, rule, regulation, or order to the same extent as the
person that committed such violation.

* * k & * * k



MINORITY VIEWS

H.R. 3641, the Stronger Enforcement of Civil Penalties Act of
2019, borrows from H.R. 10, the Financial Choice Act of 2017
(115th Congress). However, H.R. 3641 fails to include an equally
important component of H.R. 10 that ensures a balanced SEC en-
forcement program.

While H.R. 3641 raises statutory limits on certain SEC civil mon-
etary penalties as well as triples the penalty cap for certain recidi-
vists, it fails to include important reforms to the SEC’s enforcement
program that promote the rule of law and ensure due process for
the accused. The proposed reforms include, among other enhance-
ments: (1) giving respondents in SEC administrative proceedings
the right to remove their enforcement action to federal court to en-
sure that the respondents’ due process rights are protected; (2) es-
tablishing an advisory committee on the Commission’s enforcement
policies and practices to ensure that the program is attaining its
goals while respecting due process; and (3) requiring the SEC to
approve, within a year of enactment, an updated manual that sets
forth the policies and practices that the SEC will follow in the en-
forcement of the securities laws.

Without additional procedural protections, the increased pen-
alties included in H.R. 3641 do not strike the right balance be-
tween deterring and punishing securities fraud and protecting
shareholders who are ultimately responsible for paying large civil
penalties for violations that the shareholders did not commit. Fur-
ther, the SEC did not request these additional penalties, nor have
they expressed concern with the current penalty thresholds.

During the July 16, 2019 markup, Representative Davidson (R—
Ohio) offered a substitute amendment to H.R. 3641 to include the
Financial CHOICE Act’s crucial due process reforms. However, the
Chairwoman ruled the commonsense amendment non-germane.
Committee Republicans regret that the Democrats missed an op-
portunity to continue the groundwork laid in the 115th Congress
with H.R. 10, choosing instead to move a bill that the Senate will
not consider nor for which the SEC has indicated a need.

DAvID KUSTOFF.
LANCE GOODEN.
ScotT R. TIPTON.
PETER T. KING.

TREY HOLLINGSWORTH.
BRYAN STEIL.
WARREN DAVIDSON.
DENVER RIGGLEMAN.
LEE M. ZELDIN.
PaTrICK T. MCHENRY.
STEVE STIVERS.

(65)



66

BLAINE LEUTKEMEYER.
FrANK D. Lucas.

BARRY LOUDERMILK.

ToM EMMER.

TED BUDD.

ROGER WILLIAMS.

J. FRENCH HiLL.

JOHN W. ROSE (TN).
ANTHONY GONZALEZ (OH).
ANDY BARR.

ALEXANDER X. MOONEY (WV).
ANN WAGNER.

BiLL HUIZENGA.

BiLL PosEY.

WiLLiaMm R. TiMMONS, IV.

O




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2022-01-31T15:49:35-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




