AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

S. Hra. 112-978

A LEGISLATIVE HEARING ON THE WATER
RESOURCES DEVELOPMENT ACT OF 2012

HEARING

BEFORE THE

COMMITTEE ON
ENVIRONMENT AND PUBLIC WORKS
UNITED STATES SENATE

ONE HUNDRED TWELFTH CONGRESS
SECOND SESSION

NOVEMBER 15, 2012

Printed for the use of the Committee on Environment and Public Works

&R

Available via the World Wide Web: http:/www.fdsys.gov

U.S. GOVERNMENT PUBLISHING OFFICE
25-114 PDF WASHINGTON : 2017

For sale by the Superintendent of Documents, U.S. Government Publishing Office
Internet: bookstore.gpo.gov Phone: toll free (866) 512—-1800; DC area (202) 512—-1800
Fax: (202) 512-2104 Mail: Stop IDCC, Washington, DC 20402-0001



COMMITTEE ON ENVIRONMENT AND PUBLIC WORKS

ONE HUNDRED TWELFTH CONGRESS
SECOND SESSION

BARBARA BOXER, California, Chairman

MAX BAUCUS, Montana JAMES M. INHOFE, Oklahoma
THOMAS R. CARPER, Delaware DAVID VITTER, Louisiana
FRANK R. LAUTENBERG, New Jersey JOHN BARRASSO, Wyoming
BENJAMIN L. CARDIN, Maryland JEFF SESSIONS, Alabama
BERNARD SANDERS, Vermont MIKE CRAPO, Idaho

SHELDON WHITEHOUSE, Rhode Island LAMAR ALEXANDER, Tennessee
TOM UDALL, New Mexico MIKE JOHANNS, Nebraska
JEFF MERKLEY, Oregon JOHN BOOZMAN, Arkansas

KIRSTEN GILLIBRAND, New York

BETTINA POIRIER, Majority Staff Director
RUTH VAN MARK, Minority Staff Director

1)



CONTENTS

Page
NOVEMBER 15, 2012
OPENING STATEMENTS

Boxer, Hon. Barbara, U.S. Senator from the State of California ........................ 1
Inhofe, Hon. James M., U.S. Senator from the State of Oklahoma .................... 143

Alexander, Hon. Lamar, U.S. Senator from the State of Tennessee, prepared
SEALEINENT  1o.iiiiiiiiiiiiii e 145
Merkley, Hon. Jeff, U.S. Senator from the State of Oregon .. 146
Vitter, Hon. David, U.S. Senator from the State of Louisiana ...........c.cccccueeeunnn. 147
Lautenberg, Hon. Frank R., U.S. Senator from the State of New Jersey ........... 149
Johanns, Hon. Mike, U.S. Senator from the State of Nebraska ........ccccccceeeennn. 151
Boozman, Hon. John, U.S. Senator from the State of Arkansas ...........ccccceuu..... 152
Barrasso, Hon. John, U.S. Senator from the State of Wyoming ........ccccccceenneenn. 152
Whitehouse, Hon. Sheldon, U.S. Senator from the State of Rhode Island . 259
Carper, Hon. Thomas R., U.S. Senator from the State of Delaware ................... 261

WITNESSES

Curtis, Stephen A., P.E., M.ASCE, Board Member and At-Large Director,

American Society of Civil ENgineers .......ccccccccoevvieeniiieeniiienniieeeieeseieee s 154
Prepared statement ..........c.ccocccieeiiiiiiiiicee e 156
Responses to additional questions from:

Senator BOXET ......ccooiiiiiiiiiiiiiic e 165
Senator INhofe .......oocoiiiiiii e 167
Sullivan, Terry, State Director, Rhode Island Chapter, The Nature Conser-

VATICY  +evteeereesiunueeeeeeesanauseteeeeesaauuteeeeessesnssnseeeeessssstnraeesesssnusssaeessesssnsnneeeessnnnnsneees 169
Prepared statement ..........c.ccoccciieiiiiiiiiece e 172
Responses to additional questions from:

SENALOT BOXET ... ..oiiiiiieeciiiiieee e e et e e e eeecree e e e eeearreeeeeeeeaaaaeeeeeeeeennes 175, 187
Senator INNOTe..........cooiiiiiiiiie e 181, 187
Larson, Amy W., Esq., President and CEO, National Waterways Conference,

I1C ettt ettt 205
Prepared statement ..........c.coocoiieeiiiiiiiecee e 207
Responses to additional questions from:

Senator BOXET .....cccooiiiiiiiiiiictc s 219
Senator INhofe  .......oocioiiiiiiii e 224
Williams, Warren Dusty, President, NAFSMA, and General Manager and

Chief Engineer, Riverside County Flood Control and Water Conservation

DIESEIICE oottt ettt sttt ettt 227
Prepared Statement ..........coccooiiiiiiiiiiiiie e 230
Responses to additional questions from:

Senator BOXET ....cc.coiiiiiiiiiiiieeee e 239

Senator INhofe  .......occooiiiiiiiii e 241
ADDITIONAL MATERIAL

Statement of the American Public Works Association, November 15, 2012 ....... 306

(I1D)






A LEGISLATIVE HEARING ON THE WATER
RESOURCES DEVELOPMENT ACT OF 2012

THURSDAY, NOVEMBER 15, 2012

U.S. SENATE,
COMMITTEE ON ENVIRONMENT AND PUBLIC WORKS,
Washington, DC.

The full Committee met, pursuant to notice, at 10 a.m. in room
406, Dirksen Senate Office Building, Hon. Barbara Boxer (Chair-
man of the full Committee), presiding.

Present: Senators Boxer, Inhofe, Carper, Lautenberg, White-
house, Merkley, Vitter, Barrasso, Johanns, and Boozman.

OPENING STATEMENT OF HON. BARBARA BOXER,
U.S. SENATOR FROM THE STATE OF CALIFORNIA

Senator BOXER. Good morning, everybody. Welcome to this hear-
ing.

Today we are going to examine a draft bill to reauthorize WRDA,
the Water Resources Development Act. This hearing comes on the
heels of Sandy, which killed more than 120 people, destroyed entire
neighborhoods on the east coast, and cost billions of dollars in dam-
age to property and businesses. Our thoughts and prayers go out
to all the communities affected by this terrible storm. And I know,
because I have talked to Senator Vitter, when he looks at this, he
is still dealing with what happened down in his great State.

The devastation caused by Sandy puts an even brighter spotlight
on the need to ensure that communities have critical flood protec-
tion, which is one of the primary goals of the WRDA bill. The bill
before us I have drafted, based on the input of members of this
Committee and many weeks of discussion with the Ranking Mem-
ber, Senator Inhofe, the Chair and Ranking Member of the Trans-
portation and Infrastructure Subcommittee. I believe they have
been productive discussions. I got a very important letter that has
been made public, and I ask unanimous consent to put it into the
record at this time. Without objection, from all of the Republicans,
I find this letter to be very important, very constructive. And I
thank my colleagues for doing it.

[The referenced letter was not received at time of print.]

Senator BOXER. Clearly, the bill before us is my draft. And it is
going to be changed, and we are going to work on it until we all
agree. And I believe we will reach agreement, just as we were able
to do in the highway bill.

So I look forward personally to working with every member of
this Committee to refine this draft as we move forward. I have al-
ready spoken to a lot of you individually, and you have my commit-

o))



2

ment, and my staff is ready, willing, and able. We start discussions
from this moment forward.

As we discussed in September, WRDA authorizes the projects
and programs of the Army Corps, provides many benefits to Amer-
ica’s families and businesses, including maintaining navigation
routes for commerce and reducing the risk of flooding. For example,
U.S. ports and waterways, many of which are maintained by the
Corps, moved $2.3 billion tons of goods in fiscal year 2011. We are
talking about an economic issue here. And Corps flood risk man-
agement projects are estimated to have prevented $28 billion in
damages in 2010. So even though we are looking at horrific dam-
ages from Sandy, we have to realize, in 2011, the Corps flood risk
management projects prevented $28 billion in damages, in 2010.

This bill recognizes the value of our nation’s water resources in-
frastructure by authorizing projects that have been extensive re-
viewed, evaluated, and recommended to Congress for authorization.
These projects represent all of the Corps of Engineers’ primary mis-
sion areas, including flood risk and storm damage reduction, navi-
gation, ecosystem restoration. They will protect life and property
for thousands of people, restore significant ecosystems, and pro-
mote commerce.

Now, here is the thing. If we don’t act, these projects can’t go for-
ward, even though there is an engineer’s report for them, and all
the work has been done. We don’t act. And the House doesn’t act,
the President doesn’t sign the bill, these projects are not going to
move forward.

I will give you an example of just one project in my State where
we are facing very critical challenges. The WRDA bill would au-
thorize improvements to these projects that already have these en-
gineers’ reports. And they are all over the country. This particular
one is around the Natomas Basin in Sacramento, to reduce flood
risk for tens of thousands of people.

According to the Corps, these levees protect $7 billion in property
as well as critical Federal, State, and local infrastructure. I would
like to enter into the record a letter from the Sacramento Area
Flood Control Agency and Representative Matsui supporting this
WRDA bill. Without objection.

[The referenced information follows:]



November 13, 2012

Senator Barbars Boket
Chidivvotitatt, Committes piy
Environmentand Public Waotks
Rm; 210 Dirksen Building
United. States Senate
Washingtort, DC30510-6175

Senstor James M. Inhofe
Rarnking Member, Committec:on
Environiment axtd Public Works
Rm. 456 Dixksen Building
Washington, DC20510-6175

‘Deéar Chairwoman Boxeriand Raking Meniber Inhofe:

On behslf of tha Boaxd of Directors of the Sacramento. Atex; Flood Control
Agengy. (SAFCA), thank: you: for ffevelop 'lﬁ and ‘making, . available: the draft *Water
Resources Pevelopment Att of 2012.% is & major and positive development in
advancing bational obijectives for publiv safity, economiic development and job creaticn.

There are many ‘worthwhiile and: mnovatgvepmmons ant:policy-initiatives in the
draft and -we lodk : forward. to working with you.as this important legislation moves
formard. We also applaud ‘the sonvenidl of & séootid "WRDA Hisardag on Naveiber
15¢k, wiltichwill seive to:give greater public widerstanding arnd apprecidtion for the value
of respansible infrastrcture develtspment and the urgent nieed to sct on & WRDA in'a
‘imely manner. Lastly, wo eommend the Committee for its. stronghpamsan leadership
and fodus in woikiitg-collabératively to tove:a WRDA: forward:

I'd liketo briefly mention several provisions of the draft bill Hiat are especially
important to-us in: ths flood:control. community:

o Section 1002, Project Authorization - this ssction téflects a very mswnsible appmach

10 autboxiringus Ariny Corps of Engitiests projects by assiting that ihey have
completed thio Federal teview:process and are found:to be in the public/interest.

¢ ‘Sections: 2008 throught 2011,' Credits. for Non:Federal Work - thege sectioits reflect
mponam steps In efionrigiiig: ‘State anid Tocal initlative andl acceleciting fiovd

Oflice. 9188747608
fak Q168743280

1007~ 7t Street, 20 Foor
Sacrsmmm.—ﬁﬂmﬂ-ﬂiw

sl



November 13, 2012
Page 2012

control. iimprovements by allowing appropriate crediting for work accomplished by
Noni-Federal interests..

o Section2017, Vegetation Mansgérient, Policy ~ this seation, which reflects provisions
SFH.R. 5831 champiotied by Congresswoman Doris Matsui, will assure a thoyghdful,
catidinated and gpen reassessment of Corps vegetation management policy.

Chairman. Boxer: and Seriator: Inbicfe, fhaitk you Ibt your continued strong
‘bipartisan léadeérship. and pabliv’ serdice. We utge: you o move forward with this: vitally
Adiportain Jegislation 43 sooti a8 possible. ‘We Iogk forward 3o ‘working with his
Cointiritice to help make WRDA a reality:in the very near fiture:

‘Executive:Director



OORIS O, MATSUI . WASKRATON oG
B DT, CALRORAGA mc;umwuszng:ﬁ:&m
COMA%O:EE:CEEHGV 1207) 28-7183
2 DISTRICT B5ACE:
Congress of the Tnited States sosegr . T coueouse
FHouse of Wepregentatives e s
Wlashington, BE 20515-0505 Pramnibes o
November 14, 2012
The Honorable Barbara Boxer
Chairwoman
Senate Committes on
Environment and Public Warks

410 Dirksen Senate Office Building
Washington, DC 20510

The Honorable James Inhofe
Ranking Member

Senate Committee on

Environment and Public Works
456.Dirksen Senate Office Building
Washington, DC 20510

Dear Chairwoman Boxer and Ranking Member Inhofe:

1 am writing to express my strong suppart for yous legismive discussion draft that outlines your key
legislative and policy proposals that should be included in the next Water Resources Development Act
(WRDA). Your.leadership on these issues is very much appreciated by my constituents. As you know,
much of our nation's flood protection infrastructure is-in dire need of improvement and Congressional
action is necessary to prevent future floods. As the Senate’s WRIDA process moves forward, your
discyssion draft proposa! includes a number of key policies that will be criticaf to improving flood
protection in the Sacramento reglon.

1 understand the constraints that the curreat cannark ban has placed on infrastructure projects, many of

- which are.necessary to prevent futiire floods. 1am pleased that the commiteee’s WRDA discussion draft,

thmuah generic language, includes the authorization:of the Natomas Levee Improvement Project (NLIP)
in Sacramento, { introduced similar language in the House (H.R. 4353). This flood risk reduction project

- has been fully vetted and includes a Chisl"s Report, with-an endorsement by the Assistant Secretary of the

Army (Civil Works) on behalf of the Administration,

The area to'be protected by the NLIP is heavily urbanized, home to over 100,000 people, two interstate
highways and the Sacramento International Airport. Levee deficiencies were found in the area in 2006
andﬂleunawasmnappedbyFBMAmmOS ﬂanrpsofEngmemhasnldﬂwamhasn(eve!of
ﬂoodpmwuonofbelowlm!‘.iyms,, I nimum.na ds

nce . 96 peroent  of expecwd

d a levee imp:

Corps of Engincers has d

=flood:damages, remmn’ an*avefage “of $502 million ln’a.nnunl economic benefits'and has-a’benefit to.cost

‘ratioof 6o 1. I.ocaluxpayershnvevocedlomxﬂlemsetmontwosapamoccasmnstopayform

improvements.

The state'and local governments have already begun-construction and will have spent upwards of $350
million-on 18 miles of levee improvements, with 24 miles of work remaining. Without federal
authorization and further federal support, construction will come to a halt. Authorizing the NLIP is my
highest priority and Y applaud your leadership to help move this project forward.

PRONTEC ON RECYCLED PAPER



6

Tam also pleased that your committee’s WRDA discussion drakt includes legislative Janguage to address
the issues surrounding the Corps’ vegetation on levees policy. As you know, the Anmy Corps of
Engmeen released a revised PGL regarding vegeuuon on levee policy. The State of California and a
wide variely of stakeholders remain - d that the latest proposal does not provide caough
flexibility that takes into account each mgion 's unique chalienges. Por decades, the Corps® practice bas
been to protect and encoumge woody vegetation on many:levees in California and other patts of our
country. This practice is in stark conflict with the Corps’ cutren: vegetation policy.

In a time of declining federal, state and local resources, public finds should be spent first on crucial levee
fixes, rather than on removing the remaiaing vegetation from California’s riparian environment without a
site-specific, science-based evaluation. The Committee’s WRDA discussion draft includes language,
which iz identical to legislation' Yintroduced (H.R. 5831) in the House last Spring. I strongly support your
language that would require the Corps to thoroughly review and reconsider their current poBlll.Oll. Instead
of a ene-size fits‘all national standard, the bill would require the Corps to move to regional variances with
input from the atate and local entities that aro.most famitlar with the unique challenges facing each
community. -Among other things, as part of its regiona! variance policy, the language provides the Corps
with the flexibility 10 exempt areas.from the policy, where deemed nécessary by the Assistanl Secretary
of the Army Corps of Engincers. I applaud your committee for including levee vegetation language in
your discussion draft and encourage you to conlinue to include this language as the WRDA process
continnes.

Lastly, 1 vould like to express my support for-the crediting language included in the committee’s WRDA,
proposal. 1 was concerned with the. Corps* recent decision to discontinue crediting under Section 104 of
the 1986 WRDA. It hashad a ripple effect-scross the counlry, including comrmunities in the Sacramento
area; making itmore difficult for local stakehokders to invest in flod damage reduction projects. In'some
cases; the effect of this decision has already been to delay, and may eventually be to halt, local flood
protection projects. The language included in your WRDA dlswuion drafy is.a step in the nght direction,
mouragmg :State and local initiatives and accelerating flood timpr by all g
appropriste crediting for work accomplishéd by non-federal interests. .

Again, I-applaud the commities’s leadership in crafting a8 WRDA disoussion draft and for bolding a
subsequent hearing on legislative and policy goals loupgmb our nation’s flood plotecnon infrastructore,
As the WRDA process moves forward in the Senate, I remain committed (0 assisting your efforts in any
way possible.

Thank you in advance for your consid&ation and for any assistance you may provide.

Sincerely,

OmadNatpre

DORIS 0. MATSUI
Member of Congress



7

Senator BOXER. Like Natomas, there are many more life saving
flood control projects around the country that are ready to be built
following passage of WRDA, projects in Kansas, Minnesota, North
Dakota, Iowa, Kentucky, to name a few. Vital navigation projects
and significant ecosystem restoration efforts are also ready to go
once Congress acts. That is why I am so happy we all agree we
must act.

In addition to authorizing vital projects to protect life and safety
and maintain economically important navigation routes, this bill
makes essential policy reforms—which I know Senator Vitter is
particularly interested in—including increasing flexibility for non-
Federal sponsors of Corps projects, encouraging the Corps to fully
implement ongoing efforts to accelerate project delivery, urging the
expenditure of funds collected in the Harbor Maintenance Trust
Fund, reforming the process for delivery of inland waterway
projects—again, very important to members of this Committee—
and establishing a national levee safety program.

In light of the devastation caused by Sandy and other extreme
floods, I have drafted a new title, I am very excited about getting
my colleagues’ advice on this title, to help us better prepare for and
reduce the risk from these types of disasters. I have made this new
provision available to all members of the Committee, and I ask
unanimous consent to place this piece into the record at this time.
Without objection.

[The referenced information follows:]



8

CEL12932 DISCUSSION DRAFT SL.C.

112t CONGRESS
2D SESSION °

To provide for the conservation and development of water and related re-
sources, to authorize the Seeretary of the Army to construct various
projects for improvements to rivers and harbors of the United States,
and for other purposes. .

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

introduced the following bill; which was read twice
and referred to the Committee on

A BILL

To provide for the conservation and development of water
and related resources, to authorize the Secretary of the
Army to construct various projects for mprovements to
rivers and harbors of the United States, and for other

purposes.
1 Be 1t enacted by the Senate and House of Represenia-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) SHORT TITLE—This A¢t may be cited as the
“Water Resources Development Act of 20127,

{b) TaBLE OF CONTENTS.—The table of contents of

~ N B W R

this Act 1s as follows:



9

CEL12932 DISCUSSION DRAFT S.LC.
2

Sec. 1. Short title; table of contents,
Sec. 2. Definition of Seeretary.

TITLE I—WATER RESOURCE PROJECTS

See. 1001, Purposes.
See. 1002, Project authorizations.
See. 1003. Projeet review.

TITLE 1I—WATER RESOURCES POLICY REFORMS

See. 2001, Purposes.

See. 2002, Fish and wildlife mitigation.

Sec. 2003. Independent peer review,

See. 2004, Safety assurance review.

See. 2005. Continuing authority programs.

Sec. 2006, Operation and maintenance of navigation and lydroelectric facilities.

Sec. 2007. Mitigation status report,

Sec. 2008. Clarification of work-in-kind credit authority.

Sec. 2009, Transfer of excess work-in-kind eredit.

See. 2010. Credit for in-kind contributious.

Sec. 2011. Credit in lieu of reimbursement.

Sec. 2012, Dam optimization.

Sec. 2013. Implementation of biological opinious.

See. 2014, Consideration of Federal land in feasibility studies.

See. 2015. Plauning assistance to States.

See. 2016, Projeet aceeleration,

See. 2017. Vegetation management policy.

See. 2018. Operation and maintenaunce of certain projects.

See. 2019. Non-Federal project implementation pilot program.

See. 2020. Tribal partnership program.

Sec. 2021. Cooperative agreements with Cohunbia River Basin Indian tribes.

Sec. 2022, Post-disaster watershed assessments,

See. 2023, Levee certifications.

Sec. 2024, Military nunitions response actions at eivil works shoreline protec-
tion projects.

See. 2025. Beach nourishment.

See. 2026. Project deauthorizations.

TITLE 1—PROJECT MODIFICATIONS

See. 3001. Purpose.
Sec. 3002. [To be supplied].

TITLE IV—WATER RESOURCE STUDIES

See. 4001, Purpose.
See. 4002. Initiation of new water resources studies.
See, 4003. Applicability.

TITLE V—REGIONAL AND NONPROJECT PROVISIONS

See. 5001. Purpose.

See. 5002, Northeast Coastal Region ecosystem restoration.

See. 5003. Improving management of flood and drought.

Sec. 5004. Chesapeake Bay environmental restoration and protection program.



CEL12932

See.

Sea.

See.
See.
Sec.
See.
Sec.
See.
See.
Sea.

Sec.

See.
Seq.
Sec.
Sec.
See.

Sec.
See.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.

5005,

5006.

6001,
6002,
6003.
6004,
6005,
6006.
6007,
8008,
6009,

7001,
7002,
T003.
7004,
7005,

8001,
BOOZ.
8003,

9001.
9002,

e 8003,
. 9004,

9005.

. 5006.

Sec. 9007.

Sec.
See.
See,
See.
Sce,
Se.
See.
Sec.
See.
Sec.
Sece.
See,
See.

TITLE X

10001,
10002,
10003.
10004,
10045,
10006,
10007,
10008,
10009,
10010,
10011,
10012,
10013,

10

DISCUSSION DRAFT S.1.C.
3
Rio Grande envirenmental management program, Colorado, New
Mexieo, Texas,

Lower Colambia River and Tillamook Bay ecosystem restoration,
Oregon and Washington.,

TITLE VI—LEVEE SAFETY

Short title.

Findings; purposes.

Definitions.

National levee safety program.
National Levee Safety Advisory Board.
Inventory and inspection of Jevees.
Reports.

Effect of title.

Authorization of appropriations.

TITLE VII-INLAND WATERWAYS

Purposes.

Definitions.

Projeet delivery process reforins.
Major rehabilitation standards.
Efficieney of vevenue eollection.

TITLE VII—HARBOR MAINTENANCE

Purposes.
Funding for harber maintenance programs.
Harbor operation and maintenance,

TITLE IX—DAM SAFETY

Short title.

Purpose.

Administrator.

Inspection of dams.

National Dam Safety Program.

Public awareness and outreach for dam safety,
Authorization of appropriations.

INNOVATIVE FINANCING PILOT PROJECTS

Short title.

Purposes,

Definitions.

Authority to provide assistance,
Apphieations.

Eligible entities.

Projects eligible for assistance.
Activities eligible for assistanee.
Determination of eligibility and project seleetion,
Secured loans.

Program administration.

State and local permits.
Repulations.



11

CEL12932 DISCUSSION DRAFT S.L.C.

en BN o R e = T Y " R S R

[N T NG T N SR NG T NG Y S T = T e T T e S
N = DO 0 Y B W N

4

Sec. 10014, Funding,
See. 10015, Report to Congress.

SEC. 2. DEFINITION OF SECRETARY.
In this Aet, the term “Secretary’” means the See-

retary of the Army.

TITLE I—WATER RESOURCE
PROJECTS
SEC. 1001. PURPOSES.
The purposes of this title are—
(1} to authorize projects that—

(A) are the subject of a completed report
of the Chief of Engineers containing a deter-
mination that the relevant project—

(1) 15 in the Federal interest;

(i) results in benefits that exceed the
costs of the project;

(i) is environmentally acceptable; and

() is technically feasible; and

(B) have been recommended to Congress
for authorization by the Assistant Secretary of
the Army for Civil Works; and
(2) to authorize the Secretary—

(A) to review projects that require in-
creased authorization; and

{(B) to increase those authorizations

after—



12

CEL12932 DISCUSSION DRAFT S.L.C,
5
1 (i) certifying that the increases are

2 necessary; and
3 (ii) submitting to Congress reports on
4 the proposed increases.
5 SEC. 1002. PROJECT AUTHORIZATIONS,
6 The Secretary is authorized to carry out water re-
7 sources development and conservation projects subject to
8 the conditions that-—
9 {1) each project is carried out—
10 (A) substantially in accordance with the
11 plan for the project; and
12 (B) subject to any conditions deseribed in
13 the report for the project; and
14 (2) a Report of the Chief of Engineers has been
15 completed and a referral by the Assistant Secretary
16 of the Army for Civil Works has been made to Con-
17 gress as of the date of enactment of this Act for the
18 projeet.
19 SEC. 1003. PROJECT REVIEW.,
20 (a) IN GENERAL.—For a project that has been au-

21 thorized by Federal law before the date of enactment of
22 this Aect and that is under construction as of the date of
23 enaetment of this Act, the Secretary may modify the an-

24 thorized cost of a projeet by making the required certifi-



CEL12932

13

DISCUSSION DRAFT SL.C.
6

1 eation and submitting to Congress a cost recommendation

2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

in accordance with subsection (b).

(b) REQUIREMENTS. —

(1) CERTIFICATION.—The certification to Con-

gress under subseetion (a) shall include a certifi-

cation by the Secretary that—

{A) expenditures above the authorized cost
of the project are necessary to protect life and
safety, maintain critical navigation routes, or
restore ecosystems;

(B) the project provides significant na-
tional benefits;

(C) a temporary stop or delay resulting
from a failure to inerease the authorized cost of
the projeect will increase ecosts to the Federal
Government: and

(D) the amount requested for the project
in the budget of the President or included in a
work plan for the expenditure of funds for the
fiscal year during which the certification is sub-
mitted will exceed the authorized cost of the
project.

(2) RECOMMENDATION.—The recommendation

to Congress under subsection (a) shall include, at a

minimun-——



14

CEL12932 DISCUSSION DRAFT S.L.C.
7
1 {A) a comprehensive review of the project
2 costs and reasons for exceeding the limits set
3 under section 902 of the Water Resources De-
4 velopment Aet of 1986 (33 U.B.C. 2280);
5 (B) the new funding level needed to com-
6 plete the project; and
7 (C) a recommendation to increase the au-
8 thorized funding level for the project to Con-
9 oTess.
10 (¢) TERMINATION OF EFFECTIVENESS.—The author-

11 ity of the Secretary under this section terminates effective
12 on Deeember 31, 2014.

13 TITLE II—WATER RESOURCES
14 POLICY REFORMS

15 SEC. 2001. PURPOSES.

16 The purposes of this title are—

17 (1} to reform the implementation of water re-
18 sources projects by the Corps of Engineers;

19 (2) to make other technical changes to the
20 water resources policy of the Corps of Engineers;
21 and

22 (3) to accomplish the following reforms:

23 (A) Enhance the ability of local sponsors
24 to partner with the Corps of Engineers by en-

25 suring the eligibility of the local sponsors to re-



CEL12932

D -1 AN kW N~

[ ST NG TR N R N0 T N6 T N R S o
S R I N S e e T = N 7 S U FOR N R I O

15

DISCUSSION DRAFT S.L.C.
8
ceive credit for work carried out by the spon-
sors and increasing flexibility of the sponsors in
applﬁng that credit to a Corps of Engineers
project.

(B) Ensure continuing authority programs
can continue to meet important needs by in-
creasing the size and per-project limitations of
the programs.

(C) Encourage the continuation of efforts
to modernize feasibility studies and establish
targets for expedited completion of feasibility
studies.

(D)) Seek efficiencies in the management of
dams and related infrastructure to reduce envi-
ronmental impacts while maximizing other ben-
efits and projeet purposes, such as flood con-
trol, water supply, and hydropower.

(K) Clarify mitigation 1‘equire‘ments for
Corps of Engineers projects and ensure trans-
parency in the independent external review of
those projects.

() Deauthorize projects that have failed
to receive a minimum level of investment to en-
sure active projects can move forward while re-

ducing the backlog of authorized projects.



16

CEL12932 DISCUSSION DRAFT S
9

1 SEC. 2002. FISH AND WILDLIFE MITIGATION.

2 Section 906{d) of the Water Resources Development
3 Aetof 1986 (33 TL.S.C. 2283(d)(1)) is amended—

4 (1) in paragraph {1)—

5 (A) 1n the first sentence

6 (1) by ingerting “for damages to eco-
7 logieal resonrces, inclnding terrestrial and
8 aquatic resources, and” after “mitigate”;

9 (i1} by mserting “ecological resources
10 and” after “impact on”’; and

11 (iii) hy inserting “without the imple-
12 mentation of mitigation measuares” before
13 the period; and

14 (B) by inserting before the last sentence
15 the following: “If the Seeretary determines that
16 mitigation to in-kind conditions is not possible,
17 the Secretary shall identify in the report the
18 basis for that determination.”; and

19 {2) in paragraph (1)(A), by mserting “, at a
20 minimam,” after “eomplies with™.

21 SEC. 2003. INDEPENDENT PEER REVIEW,
22 (a) TrvInGg OoF PEER REvVIEW —Section 2034(h) of

23 the Water Resources Development Aet of 2007 (33 U.S.C.

24 2343(h)) 15 amended
25 (1) by redesignating paragraph (3) as para-

26 eraph (4); and



CEL12932

O 0 N N Ut bR W N e

NN N NN e ek ek e e e ek e
W NN =, O Y 0 NN AW NN = O

17

DISCUSSION DRAFT S.L.C.
10
(2) by inserting after paragraph (2) the fol-
lowing: |
“(3) REASONS FOR TIMING.—If the Chief of
Engineers does mnot initiate a peer review for a
project study at a time described in paragraph (2),
the Chief shall—

“(A) make publicly available, including on
the Internet, for each of those times, the rea-
sons for not condueting the review; and

‘“(B) include the reasons in the decision
document for the project study.”.

(b) ESTABLISHMENT OF PANELS.—Section 2034(c)

of the Water Resources Development Act of 2007 (33
U.8.C. 2343(c)) is amended by striking paragraph (4) and

inserting the following:

“(4) CONGRESSIONAL AND PUBLIC NOTIFICA-
TION.—Following the identification of a project
study for peer review under this section, but prior to
initiation of the review by the panel of expérts, the
Chief of Engineers shall-—

“(A) notify the Committee on Environment
and Public Works of the Senate and the Com-
mittee on Transportation and Infrastructure of

the House of Representatives of the review; and



18

CEL12932 DISCUSSION DRAFT 8.1.C.
11
1 “{B) make publtely available, including on
2 the Internet, information on—
3 “(i) the dates scheduled for beginning

and ending the review;

“(i1) the entity that has the contract

4

5

6 for the review; and
7 “(ii1) the names and gualifications of
8 the panel of experts.”.

9 (¢) RECOMMENDATIONS OF PANEL.—Section 2034(f)
10 of the Water Resources Development Act of 2007 (33
11 U.8.C. 2343(D)) is amended by striking paragraph (2) and

12 inserting the following:

13 “(2) PUBLIC AVAILABILITY AND SUBMISSION
14 TO CONGRESS.—After receiving a report on a project
15 study from a panel of experts under this section, the
16 Chief' of Engineers shall make available to the pub-
17 lic, ineluding on the Internet, and submit to the
18 Jommittee on Environment and Public Works of the
19 Senate and the Comumittee on Traunsportation and
20 Infrastructure of the House of Representatives—

21 “{A) a copy of the report not later than 3
22 days after the date on which the report is deliv-
23 ered to the Chief of Engineers; and

24 “(B) a copy of any written response of the

25 Chief of Engineers on recommendations con-



19

CEL12932 DISCUSSION DRAFT SLC.
12

1 tained in the report not later than 3 days after
2 the date on which the response is delivered to
3 the Chief of Engineers.

4 “(3) INCLUSION IN PROJECT STUDY.—A report
5 on a project study from a panel of experts under
6 this section and the written response of the Chief of
7 Engineers shall be included in the final decision doc-
8 ument for the project study.”.

9 (d)  APPLICABILITY.—Section 2034(h)(2) of the
10 Water Resources Development Act of 2007 (33 U.S.C.

[ o T N N e N e T T . T T T ]
S S = I - R B R I L

2343(h)(2)) is amended by striking 7 years” and insert-
ing “12 years".
SEC. 2004. SAFETY ASSURANCE REVIEW,

Section 2035 of the Water Resources Development
Act of 2007 (33 U.S.C. 2344) is amended by adding at
the end the following:

“(g) NONAPPLICABILITY OF FACA.-—The Federal
Advisory Committee Act (5 U.S.C. App.) shall not apply
to a safety assurance review conducted under this sec-
tion.”.

SEC. 2005. CONTINUING AUTHORITY PROGRAMS.

{a) SmaLL RIVER AND HARBOR IMPROVEMENT

ProJECTS.~—Section 107 of the River and Harbor Act of

1960 (33 U.S.C. 577) is amended—



CEL12932

R B e = R D " T oS

o T G T s e T e S O ey
W N = O w00 NN R W N e O

and

20
DISCUSSION DRAFT 8.1.C.
13
(1) in  subsection {(a)}, by  striking
#$35,000,000” and inserting “$50,000,000”; and
(2) in subsection (b}, by striking “$7,000,000”
and inserting “$10,000,000".

(b)) SHORE DAMAGE PREVENTION OR MITIGATION ——

Section 111{¢) of the River and Harbor Act of 1968 (33
U.8.C. 426i(c¢)) is amended by striking “$5,000,000” and
inserting “$10,000,000".

(¢) REGIONAL SEDIMENT MANAGEMENT.—Section

204 of the Water Resources Development Aet of 1992 (33

TU.8.C. 2326) 1s amended—

(1) mm subsection (¢)(1}{(C), by striking
“$5,000,000” and inserting “$10,000,000”; and

(2) by redesignating subsection (g) as sub-
section (h);

(3) by inserting after subsection (f) the fol-
lowing:

(o) APPLICABILITY,—This section does not apply to
ppl

a project authorized under the Water Resourees Develop-
ment Act of 2007 (Public Liaw 110-114; 121 Stat. 1041)
if a report of the Chief of Engineers for the project was

completed prior to the date of enactment of that Act.”;



CEL12932

21

DISCUSSION DRAFT S.L.C.
14
(4) in subsection (h) (as redesignated by para-
graph (2)), by striking “$30,000,000” and inserting
“$50,000,000".

(d) SmaLL FrLoobp CONTROL PROJECTS.—Section

205 of the Flood Control Act of 1948 (33 U.S.C. 701s)
is amended in the third sentence by striking “$7,000,000”
and inserting “$10,000,000”.

(e} PROJECT MODIFICATIONS FOR IMPROVEMENT OF

ENVIRONMENT.—Section 1135(d) of the Water Resources

Development Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2309a(d)) is amend-

(1) in the second sentenece, by striking ‘‘Not
more than 80 percent of the non-Federal may be”
and inserting ‘“‘The non-Federal share may be pro-
vided”’; and

(2) in the third sentence, by striking
“$5,000,000” and inserting “$10,000,000".

(f) AqQuaTic ECOSYSTEM RESTORATION.—Section

206(d) of the Water Resources Development Act of 1996

20 (33 U.S.C. 2330(d)) is amended by striking “$5,000,000”

21

and inserting “$10,000,000”.



22

CEL12932 DISCUSSION DRAFT S.1.0.

15

1 SEC. 2006. OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE OF NAVIGATION

2 AND HYDROELECTRIC FACILITIES.

3 (a) IN GENERAL.—Section 314 of the Water Re-
4 sources Development Act of 1990 (33 U.S.C. 2321) 1is
5 amended—

6 (1) by striking the heading and inserting the
7 following:

8 “SEC. 314. OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE OF NAVIGATION
9 AND HYDROELECTRIC FACILITIES.”;

10 (2) in the first sentence, by striking “Activities
11 currently performed” and inserting the following:

12 “(a) In GENERAL.—Activities currently performed’’;
13 (3) in the second sentence, by striking “This
14 section”” and inserting the following:

15 “h) MAJOR MAINTENANCE CONTRACTS  AL-

16 1OWED.—This section”; and

17 (4) in subsection (a) (as desipnated by para-
18 graph (2)), by inserting “navigation or” before “hy-
19 droelectrie”.

20 (b) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The table of contents

21 contained in section 1(b) of the Water Resources Develop-
22 ment Act of 1990 (104 Stat. 4604) is amended by striking
23 the item relating to section 314 and inserting the fol-

24 lowing:

“Sec. 314, Operation and maintenance of navigation and hydroelectric facili-
ties.™.



23

CEL12932 DISCUSSION DRAFT S.L.C.

16
1 SEC. 2007. MITIGATION STATUS REPORT.

Section 2036(b) of the Water Resources Development
Act of 2007 (33 U.S.C. 2283a) is amended—

(1) by redesignating paragraph (3) as para-

2

3

4

5 graph (4); and
6 (2) by inserting after paragraph (2) the fol-
7 lowing:

8 “(3) INFORMATION INCLUDED.—In reporting
9

the status of all projects included in the report, the

10 Secretary shall—

11 “(A) use a uniform methodology for deter-
12 mining the status of all projects included in the
13 report;

14 “(B) use a wmethodology that describes
15 both a qualitative and quantitative status for all
16 projects in the report; and

17 “(C) provide speeific dates for and partici-
18 pants in the consultations required under sec-
19 tion 906(d)(4)(B) of the Water Resources De-
20 velopment  Aet  of 1986 (33 U.S.C
21 2283 () (D (BY).".

22 SEC. 2008, CLARIFICATION OF WORK-IN-KIND CREDIT AU-
23 THORITY.

24 (a) NoN-FEDERAL COST SHARE.—Section 7007 of

25 the Water Resources Development Act of 2007 (121 Stat.
26 1277) 1s amended—



CEL12932

[« s B T = R B Y

| T N T N T N T N T e S S S e Y S
AW = O 0O 0 NN W B W N e

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.

(a) IN GENERAL.

(b) RESTRICTIONS.

24
DISCUSSION DRAFT S.L.C.
17
(1) in subsection (a)—
(A) by inserting ““, on, or after” after “‘be-
fore”; and
(B) by inserting ¢, program,” after
“study” each place it appears; and

(2) in subsections (b), (d), and (e), by inserting

. program,” after “study’” each place it appears.

The amendments made by

subsection (a) take effect on November 8, 2007,

SEC. 2009. TRANSFER OF EXCESS WORK-IN-KIND CREDIT.

Subject to subsection (b), the Sec-

retary may authorize a non-Federal project sponsor to
earn work-in-kind credit in excess of the required cost-
share for a study or project and apply that credit to the
required non-Federal cost-share for a different water re-

sources study or project.

(1) IN GENERAL.—Credit m excess of the non-

Federal cost-share for a projeet authorized under
this section shall meet all applicable requirements of
section 221 of the Flood Control Act of 1970 (42
U.S.C. 1962d-5b) (as amended by section 2010),
except that subsection (a)(4)(D)(i) of that section

shall not apply.



CEL12932

OO0 N N b W N

10
1
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

25

DISCUSSION DRAFT S.L.C.
18

(2) CONDITIONS.

Jredit in excess of the non-

Federal cost-share for a project may only be author-

ized under this section if—

(A) the non-Federal sponsor prepares and
submits a comprehensive plan to the Secretary
that identifies—

(i) the projects for which the non-Fed-
eral sponsor seeks to earn the excess cred-
it; and

(11) the projects with a Federal inter-
est to which that credit would be trans-
ferred; and
(B) the total amount of eredit in excess of

the non-Federal eost-share authorized does not
exceed the total non-Federal cost-share for the
projects with a Federal interest identified in the

comprehensive plan.

{e) ADDITIONAL CRITERIA—In evaluating a request

to apply excess credit earned under this section to a dif-

ferent study or project, the Secretary shall eonsider wheth-

er the transfer of the credit will—

{1) help to expedite the completion of a project

or group of projects;

and

(2) reduce costs to the Federal Government;



CEL12932

fan BN B e I T = S ¥ N L I &

o |\ o] ] W] — — — — — — — — — —
Y S = = v < L R« R L R S

26

DISCUSSION DRAFT 8.L.C.
19

(3) aid the eompletion of a project that provides

significant flood risk reduction or environmental

benefits.

(d) TERMINATION OF AUTHORITY.—The authority
provided in this section shall terminate 5 years after the
date of enactment of this Act.

(e) REPORT.—

(1) DEADLINES, —

(A) IN GENERAL.

Not later than 2 years
after the date of enactment of this Act, the See-
retary shall submit to the Committee on Envi-
ronment and Public Works of the Senate and
the Committee on Transportation and Infra-
structure of the House of Representatives an
interim report on the use of the authority under
this section.

(B) FINAL REPORT.—Not la